
30 December 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5715

Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices Enforcement Act 1994

Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices
Enforcement Amendment Regulations

(No. 2) 2003

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Fines, Penalties and
Infringement Notices Enforcement Amendment Regulations
(No. 2) 2003.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 January 2004.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Fines, Penalties
and Infringement Notices Enforcement Regulations 1994*.

[* Reprinted as at 6 August 1999.
For amendments to 10 December 2003 see Western
Australian Legislation Information Tables for 2002, Table 4,
p. 112.]

4. Schedule 2 amended

(1) Schedule 2 Part A is amended as follows:
(a) in item 1 by deleting “$10.00” and inserting instead —

“    $12.00    ”;
(b) in item 2 by deleting “$8.00” and inserting instead —

“    $10.00    ”;
(c) in item 3 by deleting “$30.00” and inserting instead —

“    $37.50    ”;
(d) in item 4 by deleting “$20.00” and inserting instead —

“    $25.00    ”.

(2) Schedule 2 Part B is amended as follows:
(a) in item 1 by deleting “$20.00” and inserting instead —

“    $25.00    ”;
(b) in item 2 by deleting “$52.00” and inserting instead —

“    $71.00    ”.



5716 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 December 2003

(3) Schedule 2 Part C is amended as follows:
(a) in item 1 by deleting “$27.00” and inserting instead —

“    $33.50    ”;
(b) in item 3 by deleting “$13.50” and inserting instead —

“    $24.00    ”;
(c) in item 4 by deleting “$30.00” and inserting instead —

“    $37.50    ”;
(d) in item 5 by deleting “$20.00” and inserting instead —

“    $25.00    ”;
(e) in item 8 by deleting “$100.00” and inserting instead —

“    $125.70    ”;
(f) in item 10 by deleting “$30.00” and inserting instead —

“    $53.00    ”;
(g) in item 11 by deleting “$100.00” and inserting

instead —
“    $124.00    ”;

(h) in item 12 by deleting “$27.00” and inserting instead —
“    $33.50    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.


