
�
��� ���������������������� ���������	

��

�

�
Local Government Act 1995 

Local Government (Functions and General) 
Amendment Regulations 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Local Government (Functions and 
General) Amendment Regulations 2005. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on the day on which 
section 10 of the Local Government Amendment Act 2004 comes 
into operation. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Local 
Government (Functions and General) Regulations 1996*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 8 September 2000. 
  For amendments to 17 March 2005 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 220 and 
Gazette 30 December 2004.] 

4. Regulation 7 amended 

  Regulation 7 is amended by deleting “$500 000” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $1 000 000    ”. 

5. Regulation 9 amended 

  Regulation 9(1) is amended by deleting “$250 000” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $500 000    ”. 

6. Regulation 11 amended 

  Regulation 11(2) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (b) by deleting “WAMA” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    WALGA    ”; 



���������	

�� ���������������������� �
���

�

 (b) after paragraph (ea) by deleting “or”; 

 (c) after paragraph (f) by deleting the full stop and inserting 
instead —  

“     
  ; or 

 (g) the goods to be supplied under the contract 
are —  

 (i) petrol or oil; or  

 (ii) any other liquid, or any gas, used for 
internal combustion engines. 

    ”. 

7. Regulation 16 amended 

  Regulation 16(3) is amended by deleting “, examined, or 
assessed”. 

8. Regulation 24E amended 

  Regulation 24E(2)(c) is amended by inserting after 
“services” —  

  “    , or the different regions,    ”. 

9. Regulation 24F amended 

  Regulation 24F(2) is amended as follows: 

 (a) after paragraph (b) by inserting —  

  “    and    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (c)(iii) by inserting after “services” —  

  “    , or the different regions,    ”; 

 (c) after paragraph (c) by deleting “; and” and inserting a 
full stop instead; 

 (d) by deleting paragraph (d). 

10. Regulation 30 amended 

  Regulation 30(2a) is amended as follows: 

 (a) after paragraph (a) by deleting “or”; 

 (b) after paragraph (b) by deleting the full stop and 
inserting —  

“     
  ; or 

 (c) the subject of Statewide public notice under 
section 3.59(4), and if the business plan 
referred to in that notice described the property 
concerned and gave details of the proposed 
disposition including —  

 (i) the names of all other parties concerned; 



�
�%� ���������������������� ���������	

��

�

 (ii) the consideration to be received by the 
local government for the disposition; 
and 

 (iii) the market value of the disposition as 
ascertained by a valuation carried out 
not more than 12 months before the 
proposed disposition. 

    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
�
�
�
�
�

——————————— 
�


