


4226 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 September 2003

4. Regulation 17 amended

Regulation 17(1) is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (aa) by deleting “$30” and inserting
instead —
3 $35 ?9;

(b) in paragraph (ac) by deleting “$250” and inserting
instead —
“ 8260

(¢) in paragraph (ad) by deleting “$50” and inserting
instead —
3 $55 ?9;

(d) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$20” and inserting
instead —
3 $25 ?9;

(e) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$100” and inserting
instead —
“ $120

(f) in paragraph (d) by deleting “$2” and inserting
instead —
3

(g) in paragraph (e) by deleting “$10” and inserting
instead —

8§25
5. Regulation 17A amended

Regulation 17A(1)(a) is amended as follows:

(a) in subparagraph (i) by deleting “$275” and inserting
instead —
“ $285 ™

(b) in subparagraph (ii) by deleting “$550” and inserting
instead —
w350

(¢) in subparagraph (iii) by deleting <*$825” and inserting
instead —
* $855

6. Regulation 17B amended

Regulation 17B(1)(a)(ii) is amended by deleting “$30” and
inserting instead —

$35
By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




