
14 November 2006 	GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 4729  

RG301* 

Betting Control Act 1954 

Betting Control Amendment Regulations 
(No. 4) 2006 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations are the Betting Control Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 January 2007. 

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Betting Control 
Regulations 1978*. 

r Reprint 4 as at 6 May 2005. 
For amendments to 10 October 2006 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, and 
Gazette 28 April and 21 July 20061 

4. Regulation 17 amended 

Regulation 17(1) is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (ac) by deleting "$270;" and inserting 
instead — 

" $275; "; 



4730 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	14 November 2006  

(b) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$535;" and inserting 
instead — 

" $550; "; 

(c) in paragraph (f) by deleting "$500." and inserting 
instead — 

" $510. ". 

5. 	Regulation 17A amended 

Regulation 17A(1)(a) is amended as follows: 

(a) in subparagraph (i) by deleting "$295;" and inserting 
instead — 

" $300; "; 

(b) in subparagraph (ii) by deleting -$595:-  and inserting 
instead — 

" $605; "; 

(c) in subparagraph (iii) by deleting "$895," and inserting 
instead — 

" $910, ". 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


