
20 May 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1797

TRANSPORT
TR302*

Road Traffic Act 1974

Road Traffic (Drivers’ Licences) Amendment
Regulations (No. 4) 2003

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation
These regulations may be cited as the Road Traffic (Drivers'
Licences) Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2003.

2. Commencement
These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2003.

3. The regulations amended
The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic
(Drivers’ Licences) Regulations 1975*.

[* Reprinted as at 5 April 2002.
For amendments to 5 May 2003 see Gazette 3 and 17 May
and 1 November 2002, and 16 and 24 April 2003.]

4. Regulation 9 amended
Regulation 9 is amended by deleting “$10.50.” and inserting
instead —

“    $11.50.    ”.

5. Regulation 9A amended
Regulation 9A(c) is amended by deleting “$10.50;” and
inserting instead —

“    $11.50;    ”.

6. Regulation 15 amended
Regulation 15 is amended as follows:

(a) in subregulation (1)(a) by deleting “$73.60,” and
inserting instead —
“    $75.80,    ”;

(b) in subregulation (1)(b) by deleting “$147.20.” and
inserting instead —
“    $151.60.    ”;



1798 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 May 2003

(c) in subregulation (2)(a) by deleting “$16.00,” and
inserting instead —
“    $16.40,    ”;

(d) in subregulation (2)(b) by deleting “$32.20.” and
inserting instead —
“    $33.10.    ”.

7. Schedule 11 amended

Schedule 11 is amended as follows:
(a) in item 1(a)(i) by deleting “49.70” and inserting

instead —
“    51.20    ”;

(b) in item 1(a)(ii) by deleting “139.50” and inserting
instead —
“    143.70    ”;

(c) in item 1(b) by deleting “38.80” and inserting instead —
“    40.00    ”;

(d) in item 2(a) by deleting “25.50” and inserting instead —
“    26.20    ”;

(e) in item 2(b) by deleting “101.50” and inserting
instead —
“    104.50    ”;

(f) in item 3 by deleting “6.80” and inserting instead —
“    9.50    ”;

(g) in item 4(a) by deleting “32.20” and inserting instead —
“    33.10    ”;

(h) in item 4(b) by deleting “102.00” and inserting
instead —
“    105.00    ”;

(i) in item 5(b) by deleting “75.30” and inserting instead —
“    77.60    ”;

(j) in item 6 by deleting “23.50” and inserting instead —
“    24.20    ”;

(k) in item 7 by deleting “14.50” and inserting instead —
“    14.90    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.


