
3806 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2 August 2002 

LA302* 

Licensed Surveyors Act 1909 

Licensed Surveyors (Licensing and Registration) 
Amendment Regulations 2002 

Made by the Land Surveyors Licensing Board with the approval of the 
Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Licensed Surveyors 
(Licensing and Registration) Amendment Regulations 2002. 

2. The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Licensed 
Surveyors (Licensing and Registration) Regulations 1990*. 

[* Published in Gazette 23 February 1990, p.  1208-14. 
For amendments to 2 July 2002 see 2001 Index to Legislation 
of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 193.] 

3. Schedule 1 amended 

Schedule 1 is amended as follows: 

(a) in items 1, 2 and 4 by deleting "$28" and inserting 
instead - 

" $30 

(b) in item 3 by deleting '$5 I" and inserting instead 

" $55 "; 
(c) in items 5 and 8(a)(ii) by deleting "$40" and inserting 

instead - 

" $42 

(d) in item 6 by deleting "$22" and inserting instead - 

" $23 "; 

(e) in item 7 by deleting "$30" and inserting instead - 

" $32 "; 

(1) in items 8(a)(i), 8(b), 9 and 10 by deleting "$100" and 
inserting instead - 
46  $105 "; 



2 August 2002 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3807 

(g) in item 11 by deleting "$7" and inserting instead — 

" $10 ". 

Made by the Land Surveyors Licensing Board, 

G. E. MARION, Secretary, 
Land Surveyors Licensing Board. 

Approved by the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


