
19 July 2002 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3413  

EN301* 

Energy Coordination Act 1994 

Energy Coordination (Licensing Fees) 
Amendment Regulations 2002 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Energy Coordination 
(Licensing Fees) Amendment Regulations 2002. 

2. The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Energy 
Coordination (Licensing Fees) Regulations 1999* . 

r Published in Gazette 15 October 1999, p. 4867-9.1 

3. Regulation 3 amended 

Regulation 3 is amended by deleting "$250" and inserting 
instead — 

44 $375  

4. Schedule 1 amended 

Schedule 1 is amended as follows: 

(a) by deleting "$100" and inserting instead — 

" $150 "; 

(b) by deleting "$1 000" and inserting instead — 

" $1 500 "; 

(c) by deleting "$1 500" and inserting instead — 

" $2 250 ''; 



3414 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 19 July 2002  

(d) by deleting "$2 500" and inserting instead — 

" $3 750 "; 

(e) by deleting "$5 000" and inserting instead — 

" $7 500 ". 

5. 	Schedule 2 amended 

Schedule 2 is amended as follows: 

(a) by deleting "$100" and inserting instead — 

" $150 "; 

(b) by deleting "$1 000" and inserting instead — 

" $1 500 "; 

(c) by deleting "$2 000" and inserting instead — 

" $3 000 "; 

(d) by deleting "$3 000" and inserting instead — 

" $4 500 ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


