
2858 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 18 June 2002 

HE302* 

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927 

Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2002 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Hospitals (Services 
Charges) Amendment Regulations (No. 2)2002. 

2. The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Hospitals 
(Services Charges) Regulations 1984*. 

[* Reprinted as at 7 December 2001.] 

3. Schedule amended 

The Schedule is amended as follows: 
(a) in Part I item 1(b)(i) by deleting "$405.00' and inserting 

instead - 
" $416.00 

(b) in Part I item 1(b)(ii) by deleting "$235.00" and 
inserting instead - 
44 $241.00 "; 

(c) in Part I item 1(c) by deleting "$30.25" and inserting 
instead - 
" $31.00 

(d) in Part I item 1(d)(i) by deleting "$99.55" and inserting 
instead - 

" $102.00 
(e) in Part I item 1(d)(ii) by deleting "$93.55" and inserting 

instead - 
46 $96.00 

(1) in Part I item 1(e) by deleting "$686.00' and inserting 
instead - 
44 $752.00 

(g) in Part II Item (b) and Part III item 1(b) by deleting 
"$94.00" and inserting instead - 
44  $96.50 "; 



18 June 2002 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2859 

(h) in Part IV Item (b) by deleting "$166.00" and inserting 
instead — 

" $170.00 "; 

(i) in Part IV Item (d) by deleting "$520.00" and inserting 
instead — 

" $624.00 "; 

(j) in Part V by deleting "$18.70" and inserting instead — 

" $19.20 ". 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


