
3092 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 28 June 2002  

MP308* 
Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Act 1982 

Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Amendment 
Regulations 2002 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. 	Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Petroleum (Submerged 
Lands) Amendment Regulations 2002. 



28 June 2002 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3093 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002. 

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Petroleum 
(Submerged Lands) Regulations 1990*. 

[* Reprinted as at 9 March 2001.] 

4. Regulation 3 amended 

(1) Regulation 3(2) is amended by deleting "$2.00" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $3.00 

(2) Regulation 3(4) is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$25" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $26 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting $25" and inserting 
instead - 
" $26 ". 

(3) Regulation 3(5) is amended as follows: 
(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$25" and inserting 

instead - 
44 $26 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$25" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $26 ". 

(4) Regulation 3(6) is amended by deleting "$11 100.00-  and 
inserting instead - 

" $1 129.00 ". 

(5) Regulation 3(7) is amended by deleting $55.00' and inserting 
instead - 

" $57.00 ". 

(6) Regulation 3(8) is amended by deleting "$6 600.00' and 
inserting instead - 

" $6 772.00 ". 

(7) Regulation 3(9) is amended by deleting "$19 800.00" and 
inserting instead - 

$25 740.00 ". 



3094 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 28 June 2002 

5. 	Schedule 1 replaced 

Schedule 1 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead 

44 

Schedule 1 

Column 1 
Item 

Prescribed fees 
Column 2 

Provision of 
Act 

[r. 3(1)] 

Column 3 
Amount of 
prescribed 

fee 
1 s. 21(1)(f) $3 078.00 
2 s. 24(1)(a) $3 078.00 
3 s. 30(2)(c) $1 232.00 
4 s. 38A(2)(e) $1 232.00 
5 s. 38F(2)(d) $1 232.00 
6 s. 41(1)(e) $1 232.00 
7 s. 48(1)(a) $3 078.00 
8 s. 51(2)(e) $616.00 
9 s. 54(2)(d) $1 232.00 
10 s. 64(1)(f) $3 078.00 
11 s. 68(2)(c) $1 232.00 
12 s. 71(2)(e) $616.00 
13 s. 79(2) $62.00 
14 s. 79(3)(b) $62.00 
15 s. 86(1) $13.00 
16 s. 87(3) $31.00 
17 S. 111(2)(d) $616.00 
18 s. 141 $91.00 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


