
3090 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 28 June 2002 

MP306* 
Petroleum Act 1967 

Petroleum Amendment Regulations 2002 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Petroleum Amendment 
Regulations 2002. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002. 

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Petroleum 
Regulations 1987*. 

[* Reprinted as at 4 May 2001.] 

4. Regulation 3 amended 

(1) Regulation 3(2) is amended by deleting "$2.00" and inserting 
instead - 

" 	$3.00 	". 

(2) Regulation 3(4) is amended as follows: 
(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$25" and inserting 

instead - 
" 	$26 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$25" and inserting 
instead - 
" 	$26 	". 

(3) Regulation 3(5) is amended as follows: 
(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$25" and inserting 

instead - 
" 	$26 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$25" and inserting 
instead - 
" 	$26 	". 

(4) Regulation 3(6) is amended by deleting "$55.00" and inserting 
instead - 
" 	$57.00 	". 

(5) Regulation 3(7) is amended by deleting "$6 600.00" and 
inserting instead - 
46 	$6 772.00 	". 



28 June 2002 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3091 

(6) Regulation 3(8) is amended by deleting "$19 800.00" and 
inserting instead — 

" $25 740.00 ". 

5. 	Schedule 1 replaced 

Schedule 1 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead — 

44 

Schedule 1 

Column 1 
Item 

1 
2 
2a 

Prescribed fees 
Column 2 

Provision of Act 

s. 31(1)(f) 
s. 34(1)(a) 
s. 37A(2)(e) 

[r. 3(1)] 

Column 3 
Amount of 

prescribed fee 
$3078.00 
$3 078.00 

$616.00 
3 s. 40(2)(c) $1 232.00 
3a s. 43B(1)(f) $3 078.00 
3b s. 43F(3)(d) $1 232.00 
4 s. 48A(2)(e) $1 232.00 
5 s. 48F(2)(d) $1 232.00 
6 s. 51(1)(e) $1 232.00 
7 s. 58(1)(a) $3 078.00 
8 s. 61(2)(e) $616.00 
9 s. 64(2)(d) $1 232.00 
10 s. 73(2) $62.00 
11 s. 73(3)(b) $62.00 
12 s.80(1) $13.00 
13 s.81(3) $31.00 
14 s. 105(2)(d) $616.00 
15 s. 137(a) $1 129.00 

1) 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


