21 May 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2595

WORKSAFE

WS301*
Occupational Safety and Health Act 1984

Occupational Safety and Health Amendment
Regulations (No. 3) 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Occupational Safety and
Health Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2002.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Occupational
Safety and Health Regulations 1996*.

[* Reprinted as at 15 October 1999.
For amendments to 27 March 2002 see 2000 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 239, and
Gazette 30 March and 13 July 2001 and 8 March 2002.]

4. Schedule 6.1 amended
Schedule 6.1 is amended by deleting “$23.25” and inserting
instead —
“ $23.75 .

5. Schedule 6.1A amended

Schedule 6.1A is amended as follows:
(a) Dby deleting “$3 017” and inserting instead —
“ $3095
(b) by deleting “$2 000 and inserting instead —
“ %2052 7
(c) by deleting “$1 000” and inserting instead —
“ $1026 .



2596

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 21 May 2002

Schedule 6.2 amended

Schedule 6.2 is amended as follows:
(a) Dby deleting “$59.00” and inserting instead —

“ $61.00
(b) Dby deleting “$59.00” and inserting instead —
“ $61.00 .
Schedule 6.2A amended

Schedule 6.2A is amended by deleting “$3 092 and inserting
instead —

“ 83172

Schedule 6.3 amended

Schedule 6.3 is amended as follows:

(a) Dby deleting “$59.00” and inserting instead —
“ $61.00 7

(b) Dby deleting “$31.00” and inserting instead —
“$32.00 7

(c) Dbydeleting “$713.00” and inserting instead —
“$732.00

(d) by deleting “$119.00” and inserting instead —
“$122.00 7

(e) by deleting “$357.00” and inserting instead —
“ $366.00 .

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




