
672 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	28 February 2003  

MP304* 

Petroleum (Registration Fees) Act 1967 

Petroleum (Registration Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2003 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Petroleum (Registration 
Fees) Amendment Regulations 2003. 

2. The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Petroleum 
(Registration Fees) Regulations 1990*. 

[* Published in Gazette 28 September 1990, p. 5108. 
For amendments to 13 February 2003 see Gazette 
28 June 2002.] 



28 February 2003 	GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 673  

3. 	Regulation 3 amended 

(1) Regulation 3(1) is amended by deleting "$616.00" and inserting 
instead — 

" $780.00 ". 

(2) Regulation 3(2) is amended by deleting "$616.00" and inserting 
instead — 

" $780.00 ". 

(3) Regulation 3(3) is amended by deleting "$3 078.00-  and 
inserting instead — 

" $3 900.00 ". 

(4) Regulation 3(4) is amended by deleting "$616.00" and inserting 
instead — 

" $780.00 ". 

(5) Regulation 3(5) is amended by deleting "$3 078.00" and 
inserting instead — 

" $3 900.00 ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


