
27 June 2003 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2385 

EN301* 

Energy Operators (Powers) Act 1979 

Energy Operators (Western Power Corporation) 
(Charges) Amendment By-laws 2003 

Made by the Western Power Corporation with the approval of the 
Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These by-laws may be cited as the Energy Operators (Western 
Power Corporation) (Charges) Amendment By-laws 2003. 

2. Commencement 

These by-laws come into operation on 1 July 2003. 



2386 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 27 June 2003 

3. The by-laws amended 

The amendments in these by-laws are to the Energy Operators 
(Western Power Corporation) (Charges) By-laws 1996*. 

[* Reprinted as at 20 April 2001. 
For amendments to 13 June 2003 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2002, Table 4, p. 92.] 

4. Schedule 5 amended 

(1) Schedule 5 item 3 is amended by deleting "$23.50" and 
inserting instead — 

" $27.50 ". 

(2) Schedule 5 item 5(b) is amended by deleting "$390.90" and 
inserting instead — 

" $600.00 ". 

The Common Seal of the 
Western Power Corporation was 

	
[LS] 

affixed to these by-laws 
in the presence of- 

WALTER STEPHEN VAN DER MYE, Director. 
MARK HANDS, Executive Officer. 

Approved by the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


