
6 November 2001 	GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 5837 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 

C E301* 

Real Estate and Business Agents Act 1978 

Real Estate and Business Agents (General) 
Amendment Regulations 2001 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Real Estate and Business 
Agents (General) Amendment Regulations 2001. 

2. Regulation 11 amended 

Regulation 11(b) of the Real Estate and Business Agents 
(General) Regulations 1979* is amended as follows: 

(a) in subparagraph (i) by deleting "1%" and inserting 
instead — 

" 4.5% "; 

(b) in subparagraph (ii) by deleting "64%" and inserting 
instead 
44 57%  ”; 

(c) in subparagraph (iii) by deleting "35%" and inserting 
instead — 

" 38.5% ". 

[* Reprinted as at 28 November 1997. 
For amendments to 11 October 2001 see 2000 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 294.] 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor 
and deputy of the Governor, 

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


