
12 October 2001 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 5563 

JU301 
Public Trustee Act 1941 

Public Trustee Amendment Regulations 2001 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Public Trustee 
Amendment Regulations 2001. 

2. Second Schedule amended 

The Second Schedule to the Public Trustee Regulations 1942* 
is amended as follows: 

(a) in clause 1(1)(a)(i), by deleting "$30" and inserting 
instead — 

" $33 "; 

(b) in clause 1(1)(a)(ii), by deleting "10%" and inserting 
instead — 

" 11% "; 

(c) in clause 3, by deleting "1.375%" and inserting 
instead 

1.25% 

(d) in clause 9A(2)(a), by deleting "$30" and inserting 
instead 
44 $33  ”; 

(e) in clause 9A(2)(b), by deleting -1013/0-  and inserting 
instead — 

" 11% "; 

(1) in clause 9A(2)(c), by deleting "0.2%" in both places 
where it occurs and inserting instead — 

" 0.22% "; 

(g) in clause 9A(2)(c), by deleting "$200" in both places 
where it occurs and inserting instead — 

" $220 ". 

[* Reprinted as at 3 October 2000. 
For amendments to 23 August 2001 see 2000 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 287-81 

By Command of the Governor, 

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


