
12 December 20001 	GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 7153 

-PART 1- 

JUSTICE 

Ji\1301 

Local Courts Act 1904 

Local Court Amendment Rules (No. 4) 2000 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These rules may be cited as the Local Court Amendment Rules 
(No. 4) 2000. 

2. Commencement 

These rules come into operation on the day after the last day of 
the specified period, which is the period of one month after the 
day on which these rules are published in the Gazette. 

3. Appendix amended 

Appendix Part II Bailiff Fees to the Local Court Rules 1961*  is 
amended as follows: 

(a) in item 3(a) by deleting "$0.75" in the first place where 
it occurs and inserting instead - 
46 $0.85 "; 

(b) in item 3(a) by deleting "$0.75" in the second place 
where it occurs and inserting instead - 
" $0.95 "; 

(c) in item 3(b)(i) by deleting "$5.00" and inserting 
instead - 
" $6.00 

(d) in item 3(b)(ii)(I) by deleting "$5.00" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $6.00 

(e) in item 3(b)(ii)(II) by deleting "$1.70" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $2.00 "; 



7154 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	[12 December 2000 

(1) in item 3(b)(ii)(III) by deleting "$5.00" and inserting 
instead — 

" $6.00 ". 

[* Reprinted 26 February 1996. 
For amendments to 27 October 2000 see 1999 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 165, and Gazette 
24 March, 30 June and 29 August 2000.] 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


