
7928 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	[29 December 2000 

PT302* 

Public Trustee Act 1941 

Public Trustee Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2000 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Public Trustee 
Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2000. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 January 2001. 

3. Second Schedule amended 

The Second Schedule to the Public Trustee Regulations 1942* 
is amended as set out in the Table to this regulation. 



29 December 2000] 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 

Table 

Item 1(1)(a)(iii) Delete "4%", insert instead — 
" 	4.4% 	". 

Item 1(1)(b)(ii)(I) Delete "6%", insert instead — 
" 	6.6% 	". 

Item 2(1) Delete "4%", insert instead — 
" 	4.4% 	". 

Item 3A(1) Delete "6%", insert instead — 
" 	6.6% 	". 

Item 5 Delete "6%", insert instead — 
" 	6.6% 	". 

Item 9A(5) Delete "4%". insert instead — 
" 	4.4% 	". 

[* Reprinted as at 3 October 2000.] 

By Command of the Governor, 

7929 

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


