
4768 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 [18 August 2000  

HE304* 

Psychologists Registration Act 1976 

Psychologists Board Amendment Rules 2000 

Made by the Psychologists Board of Western Australia with the approval 
of the Administrator in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These rules may be cited as the Psychologists Board 
Amendment Rules 2000. 

2. The rules amended 

The amendments in these rules are to the Psychologists Board 
Rules 1978*. 

r Reprinted as at 10 February 1998. 
For amendments to 20 June 2000 see 1999 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 2411 

3. Rule 50 amended 

Rule 50 is amended by deleting "175" in both places where it 
occurs and inserting instead — 

" 192.50 ". 



18 August 20001 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 4769  

4. Rule 59 amended 

Rule 59(1) is amended by deleting "$175" in each place where it 
occurs and inserting instead — 

" $192.50 " 

5. Rule 60 amended 

Rule 60 is amended by deleting "$15" and inserting instead — 

" $16.50 ". 

6. 	Rule 66 amended 

Rule 66 is amended by deleting "$2 to $30." and inserting 
instead — 

" $2.20 to $33. ". 

The Common Seal of the ) 
Psychologists Board of 	) 
Western Australia was 
affixed hereto in the 
presence of 

JOHN HEWLETT HOGBEN 
Chairman. 

Approved by the Administrator, 

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


