
3844 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 114 July 2000  

LG303* 

Local Government Act 1995 

Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960 

Local Government (Appeals to Building 
Referees) Amendment Regulations 2000 

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council. 

1. 	Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Local Government 
(Appeals to Building Referees) Amendment Regulations 2000. 



14 July 2000] 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3845  

2. The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Local 
Government (Appeals to Building Referees) Regulations 1961*. 

[* Published in Gazette 29 June 1961, p. 2064. 
For amendments to 21 June 2000 see 1999 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 172-3.] 

3. Regulation 2 amended 

Regulation 2 is amended by deleting "$180" and inserting 
instead — 

" $200 ". 

4. Regulation 5 amended 

Regulation 5 is amended by deleting "$90" and inserting 
instead — 

" $100 ". 

By Command of the Administrator, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


