
2848 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5 June 2001

AG303*

Beekeepers Act 1963

Beekeepers Amendment Regulations 2001

Made by the deputy of the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These  regulations may be cited as the Beekeepers Amendment
Regulations 2001.

2. Commencement

These  regulations come into operation on 1 July 2001.

3. Third Schedule amended

The Third Schedule to the Beekeepers Regulations 1963* is
amended as follows:

(a) in item 1 —

(i) by deleting “$36.00” and inserting instead —

“    $37.10    ”;

(ii) by deleting “$68.00” and inserting instead —

“    $70.10    ”; and

(iii) by deleting “$111.00” and inserting instead —

“    $114.00    ”;

(b) in item 2 by deleting “$14.00” and inserting instead —

“    $14.50    ”.

[* Reprinted as at  23 April 1999.
For amendments to 4 May 2001 see 2000 Index to Legislation
of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 29-30.]

By Command of the deputy of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.


