
4 May 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2241

—  PART  1  —

HEALTH

HE301*

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2001

Made by the deputy of the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Hospitals (Services
Charges) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2001.

2. Schedule amended

Part I of the Schedule to the Hospitals (Services Charges)
Regulations 1984* is amended as follows:

(a) in item 1(c) by deleting “$29.10” and inserting
instead —

“    $29.65    ”;
(b) in item 1(d)(i) by deleting “$94.40” and inserting

instead —

“    $97.70    ”;
(c) in item 1(d)(ii) by deleting “$88.40” and inserting

instead —

“    $91.70    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 26 November 1999.
For amendments to 2 April 2001 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 143, and Gazette
30 June 2000, and 16 and 30 January 2001.]

By Command of the deputy of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.


