3008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [20 June 2000

AG307*
Artificial Breeding of Stock Act 1965

Artificial Breeding of Stock Amendment
Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

Part 1 — Preliminary

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Artificial Breeding of
Sock Amendment Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

Part 2 — Artificial Breeding (Cattle) Regulations 1978

3. Regulation 5 amended

Regulation 5(2) of the Artificial Breeding (Cattle) Regulations
1978* isrepealed and the following subregulation is inserted
instead —

(2) Thefollowing fees are payable in respect of the matters
listed below:
(@) for theissue or renewa of alicence for
the collection and processing of semen for

general SAleor USE.....cceevveeveveeniecieseeseeens 300.00
(b) for theissue or renewd of alicencefor
storage and sale of semen ... 200.00

(c) for theissue or renewa of alicence for
the transplanting of ova and processes of
production, handling, fertilization,
implantation and storage of ovafor

general SAleor USE.....cceevveeieeeenieieeieesieens 300.00
(d) forthetransfer or variation of alicence....  48.00
(e) for anapplication for a certificate of
competency —
) in respect of the class of
herdsman-inseminator .................. 29.50
(i) in respect of any other class.......... 200.00.

[* Published in Gazette 26 January 1979, pp. 240-58.
For amendments to 26 May 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legidation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 15.]



20 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3009

Part 3 — Artificial Breeding (Goats) Regulations 1986

4. Schedule 2 amended

Schedule 2 to the Artificial Breeding (Goats) Regulations 1986*
isamended as follows:

(@ by deeting “$248” and inserting instead —
“ $300 7
(b) by deleting “$47” and inserting instead —
“ $48 7
(c) by deeting “$29” and inserting instead —
$29.50
(d) by deeting “$140" and inserting instead —
$200

[* Published in Gazette 14 March 1986, pp. 755-6.
For amendments to 26 May 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legidation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 15.]

Part 4 — Artificial Breeding (Horses) Regulations 1982

5. Schedule 1 amended
Schedule 1 to the Artificial Breeding (Horses) Regulations
1982* is amended as follows:
(8 by deleting “$248” and inserting instead —
“ $300 7
(b) by deleting “$47” and inserting instead —
“ $48 7
(c) by ddeting “$140” and inserting instead —
$200
[* Published in Gazette 10 September 1982, pp. 3669-73.

For amendments to 26 May 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 15-6.]

Part 5 — Artificial Breeding (Pig) Regulations 1984

6. Regulation 4 amended

Regulation 4 of the Artificial Breeding (Pig) Regulations 1984*
isamended as follows:

(@ inparagraph (a) by deleting “$248” and inserting
instead —
“ $300



3010 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [20 June 2000

(b) inparagraph (b) by deleting “$47” and inserting
instead —
13 $4-8 ’
(¢) inparagraph (c)(i) by deleting “$29” and inserting
instead —
$29.50 7;
(d) inparagraph (c)(ii)by deleting “ $140” and inserting
instead —
$200

[* Published in Gazette 9 November 1984, pp. 3616-8.
For amendments to 26 May 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legidation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 16.]

Part 6 — Artificial Breeding (Sheep) Regulations 1983

7. Regulation 5 amended

Regulation 5 of the Artificial Breeding (Sheep) Regulations
1983* isamended as follows:

(@ inparagraph (a) by deleting “$248” and inserting
instead —
“ $300 7
(b) inparagraph (b) by deleting “$47” and inserting
instead —
13 $4-8 ’
(¢) inparagraph (c)(i) by deleting “$29” and inserting
instead —
$29.50 7;
(d) inparagraph (c)(ii)by deleting “ $140” and inserting
instead —
$200

[* Reprinted as at 7 January 2000.]
By Command of the Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHORPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




