
3038 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [20 June 2000

TR302*

Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967
Jetties Act 1926

Western Australian Marine Act 1982

Navigable Waters Amendment Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Navigable Waters
Amendment Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Navigable
Waters Regulations*.

[* Reprinted as at 3 March 2000.]

4. Regulation 3A amended

Regulation 3A is amended as follows:

(a) by deleting “it”;

(b) in paragraph (a) by deleting “has” and inserting
instead —

“    the vessel has    ”;

(c) in paragraph (b) be deleting “is” and inserting instead —

“    the vessel is    ”.

5. Regulation 40 amended

Regulation 40 is amended by deleting “with or without hard
labour”.

6. Regulation 45 amended

Regulation 45 is amended by deleting “with or without hard
labour”.



20 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3039

7. Regulation 45B amended

(1) Regulation 45B(3) is amended by deleting the Table to the
subregulation and inserting the following table instead —

“
Table of fees

Where the length of the vessel is — 

(i) less than 5 m $50

(ii) 5 m or over but less than 10 m $98

(iii) 10 m or over but less than 20 m $182

(iv) 20 m or over $249

    ”.

(2) Regulation 45B(4) is amended by deleting “$23.00” and
inserting instead —

“    $23.50    ”.

8. Regulation 45BA amended

(1) Regulation 45BA(2) is amended by deleting from “fee of —” to
the end of the subregulation and inserting instead —

“    fee of $211 for the issue of each set of plates.    ”.

(2) Regulation 45BA(3) is amended by deleting “$156.00” and
inserting instead —

“    $159    ”.

(3) Regulation 45BA(6) is amended by deleting “$57.00” and
inserting instead —

“    $58    ”.

9. Regulation 45D amended

Regulation 45D(2) is amended by deleting “, on payment of a
fee of $5.20,”.

10. Regulation 53 amended

Regulation 53(1) is amended by deleting “, with or without hard
labour”.

By Command of the Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.


