
3252 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [27 June 2000

MN302*

Petroleum Act 1967

Petroleum Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2000

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Petroleum Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Petroleum
Regulations 1987*.

[* Published in Gazette 23 October 1987, pp. 3971-2.
For amendments to 12 January 2000 see 1998 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 230-1.]

4. Regulation 3 amended

(1) Regulation 3(6) is amended by deleting “$50.00” and inserting
instead —

“    $55.00    ”.

(2) Regulation 3(7) is amended by deleting “$6 000.00” and
inserting instead —

“    $6 600.00    ”.

(3) Regulation 3(8) is amended by deleting “$18 000.00” and
inserting instead —

“    $19 800.00    ”.

5. Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 item 15 is amended by deleting “$1 000” and
inserting instead —

“    $1 100    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.


