
30 June 20001 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3429 

PT301* 

Public Trustee Act 1941 

Public Trustee Amendment Regulations 2000 

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Public Trustee 
Amendment Regulations 2000. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000. 

3. 	Second Schedule amended 

The Second Schedule to the Public Trustee Regulations 1942* 
is amended in the manner set out in the Table to this regulation. 

Table 

Item 1(1)(a)(iii) 	 Delete "3%" and insert instead 
3.3%  ”. 

Delete "2%" and insert instead — 
" 2.2% ". 

Delete "1%" and insert instead — 
" 1.1% ". 

Item 1(1)(b)(i)(II) 

Item 1(1)(b)(ii)(II) 

Delete "21/2 per centum" and insert 
instead — 
" 2.75% ". 

Delete "21/2 per centum" and insert 
instead — 
" 2.75% ". 



3430 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 130 June 2000 

Item 1(la)(a) Delete "1%" and insert instead - 
44 	1.1% 	". 

Item 1(1 a)(b) Delete "1 Y2 per centum" and insert 
instead - 
44 	1.65% 	". 

Item 1(1 a)(c) Delete "1 Y2 per centum" and insert 
instead - 
44 	1.65% 	". 

Item 1(la)(d) Delete "1Y2%" and insert instead 
" 	1.65% 	". 

Item 2(1 a) Delete "2%" and insert instead 
14 	2.2% 	". 

Item 3 Delete "1.25%" and insert instead - 
" 	1.375% 	". 

Item 3B Delete "$100" and insert instead 
44 	$110 	". 

Item 4(2) Delete "3%" and insert iiistead 

" 	3.3% 	". 

Item 5 Delete "3V2 per centum" and insert 
instead - 
" 	3.85% 	". 

Item 6 Delete "1%" and insert instead - 
44 	1.1% 	". 

Item 7 Delete "$25" and insert instead - 
" 	$27.50 	". 

Delete "$50" and insert instead - 
" 	$55 	". 

Item 9A(4) Delete "2.50/o" and insert instead - 
" 	2.75% 	". 

Item 9B(2) (Table) Delete "20" and insert instead - 
" 	22 
Delete "50" and insert instead - 
" 	55 	,, 

Delete "60" and insert instead - 
44 	66 



30 June 20001 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3431 

Item 9C(2) (Table) 	Delete "50" and insert instead - 
4C 55  ”. 

Delete "100" and insert instead — 
" 110 ". 
Delete "150" and insert instead — 
" 165 ". 
Delete "200" and insert instead — 
" 220 ". 

Delete "300" and insert instead — 
" 330 ". 
Delete "500" and insert instead — 
" 550 ". 
Delete "1 000" and insert instead — 
" 1 100 ". 
Delete "2 500" and insert instead — 
" 2 750 ". 

Item 9D (Table) 	Delete "$70" and insert instead 
44 $77  ”. 

Delete "$100" and insert instead — 
" $110 ". 

Item 9F 	 Delete "$25" and insert instead — 
" $27.50 ". 

Item 96(a) 	 Delete "$100" and insert instead — 
" $110 ". 

Item 9G(b) 	 Delete "$100" and insert instead 
" $110 ". 

[* Reprinted as authorised 17 January 1979. 
For amendments to 15 June 2000 see 1999 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 243-4.] 

By Command of the Administrator, 

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


