
30 June 20001 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3403 

FAIR TRADING 

FT3O1 

Weights and Measures Act 1915 

Weights and Measures Amendment 
Regulations 2000 

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Weights and Measures 
Amendment Regulations 2000. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000. 

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Weights and 
Measures Regulations 1927*. 

[* Published in Gazette 3 June 1927, pp. 1416-48. 
For amendments to 7 June 2000 see 1999 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 325-31.] 

4. 	Table XIII amended 

Table XIII is amended as follows: 
(a) in item 1(a) by deleting "16.00" and inserting instead - 

" 17.60 "; 
(b) in item 1(b) by deleting "$32.00" and inserting 

instead - 

" $35.20 
(c) in item 2(a) and (b) by deleting "16.00" and inserting 

instead - 

" 17.60 
(d) in item 2(c) by deleting "$32.00" and inserting 

instead - 
" $35.20 

(e) in item 3(a) and (b) by deleting "16.00" and inserting 
instead - 
" 17.60 

(f) in item 3(c) by deleting "$32.00" and inserting 
instead - 
46  $35.20 "; 



3404 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 130 Jutie 2000 

(g) in item 4(a) by deleting "64.00" and inserting instead - 
" 70.40 "; 

(h) in item 4(b) - 
(i) by deleting "64.00" and inserting instead - 

" 70.40 "; and 
(ii) by deleting "$28.00" and inserting instead - 

46 $30.80 "; 
(i) in item 5 by deleting "$32.00" and inserting instead - 

46 $35.20 "; 
(j) in item 6 by deleting "24.00" and inserting instead - 

" 26.40 "; 
(k) in item 7(a) by deleting "16.00" and inserting instead - 

" 17.60 "; 
(1) in item 7(b) by deleting "32.00" and inserting instead - 

" 35.20 "; 
(m) in item 7(c) by deleting "64.00" and inserting instead - 

" 70.40 "; 
(n) in item 8(a) by deleting "48.00" and inserting instead 

" 52.80 "; 

(o) in item 8(b) by deleting "64.00" and inserting instead - 
" 70.40 "; 

(p) in item 8(c) by deleting "128.00" and inserting 
instead - 
" 140.80 

(q) in item 9 by deleting "64.00" and inserting instead - 
" 70.40 "; 

(r) in item 10(a) by deleting "32.00 and inserting 
instead - 
" 35.20 

(s) in item 10(b) by deleting "$32.00" and inserting 
instead - 
" $35.20 

(t) in item 11 by deleting "16.00" and inserting instead - 

" 17.60 "; 

(u) in item 12 by deleting "48.00" and inserting instead - 
" 52.80 "; 

(v) in item 13 by deleting "$32.00" and inserting instead - 
" $35.20 "; 

(w) in item 14 by deleting "S 16.00"' and inserting instead - 
46  $17.60 ". 



30 June 20001 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA  

5. 	Table XIIIB amended 

Table XIIIB is amended as follows: 

(a) in item 6(a) and (b) by deleting "32.00" and inserting 
instead — 

“ 35.20 "; 

(b) in item 6(c)(i) by deleting "16.00" and inserting 
instead — 

" 17.60 "; 

(c) in item 6(c)(ii) by deleting "$32.00" and inserting 
instead — 

" $35.20 "; 

(d) in item 6(c)(iii) by deleting "16.00" and inserting 
instead — 

" 17.60 "; 

(e) in item 6(d)(i) by deleting "0.60" and inserting 
instead — 

" 0.66 "; 

(0 in item 6(d)(ii) by deleting -0.30-  and inserting 
instead — 

" 0.33 "; 

(g) in item 6(e) by deleting "32.00" and inserting instead — 

“ 35.20 "; 

(h) in item 7(a), (b) and (c) by deleting "16.00" and 
inserting instead — 

" 17.60 "; 

(i) in item 8 by deleting "$16.00" and inserting instead — 

" $17.60 ". 

By Command of the Administrator, 

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

3405 

 


