
17 May 20001 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2421 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Fees for Vehicle Licences) 
Regulations 200() 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Road Traffic (Fees for 
Vehicle Licences) Regulations 2000. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on the day on which the 
Road Traffic (Licensing) Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2000 
come into operation. 

3. Specified day: section 28A 

For the purposes of section 28A(3) of the Act, the specified day 
in relation to these regulations is 1 July 2000. 

4. The Road Traffic Act 1974 amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to Part III of the 
Second Schedule to the Road Traffic Act 19 74* 
[* Reprinted as at 17 September 1999. 

For subsequent amendments see 1999 Index to Legislation of 
Western Australia, Table 1, p.  219.] 

5. Second Schedule amended 

(1) Part III Division 2 of the Second Schedule is amended as 
follows: 

(a) in clause 2(1) by deleting "$12.26" and inserting 
instead - 

" $12.51 

(b) in clause 3 by deleting "$12.26" and inserting instead - 

" $12.51 "; 
(c) in clause 4 by deleting $6. 13" and inserting instead - 

" $6.25 "; 
(d) in clause 5 by deleting "$3.06" and inserting instead - 

44 $3.12 "; 
(e) in clause 5 by deleting "class iSV" and inserting 

instead - 
46  class PSV or TSV "; 



2422 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 [17 May 2000 

(1) in clause 6(1) by deleting "$24.52" and inserting 
instead - 

" $25.03 

(g) in clause 6(2) by deleting "$36.79" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $37.56 ". 

(2) Part III Division 4 of the Second Schedule is amended as 
follows: 

(a) in clause 4 by deleting the Table and inserting instead 
the following Table - 

IE 

Table 
Licence Class Fee 

$ 
lR2 300 
2R2 500 
lR3 600 
2R3 800 
1R4 900 
2R4 2000 
lR5 900 
2R5 2000 
SR2 550 
SR3 2000 
SR4 2000 
SR5 2000 
MR2 3 800 
MR3 3 800 
MR4 4 100 
MRS 4 100 
LR2 5 250 
LR3 5 250 
LR4 5 250 
LR5 5 250 

(b) in clause 5 by deleting the Table and inserting instead 
the following Table - 

Table 
Licence Class Fee 

$ 
SP2 1 300 
SP3 3 400 
SP4 4400 
SP5 4400 
MP2 4 000 
MP3 5 000 
MP4 5 500 
MP5 5 500 
1LP2 5000 
1LP3 5000 



17 May 2000] 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2423 

Licence Class Fee 
$ 

1LP4 5 500 
1LP5 5 500 
2LP2 5 000 
2LP3 5 000 
2LP4 5 500 
2LP5 5 500 

(c) 	in clause 6 by deleting "$250" and inserting 
instead — 

" $300 "; 

(d) 	in clause 7 by deleting the Table and inserting instead 
the following Table — 

44 

Table 
Licence Class Fee 

$ 
PSV 75 
TSV 75 

OSV2 250 
OSV3 500 
OSV4 750 
OSV5 1000 
OSV6 1250 
OSV7 1500 
OSV8 1750 
OSV9 2000 

By Command of the Governor, 

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


