
1 February 20001 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 379 

CE301' 

Architects Act 1921 

Architects' Board of Western Australia 
Amendment By-laws 1999 

Made by the Architects' Board of Western Australia. 

	

1. 	Citation 

These by-laws may be cited as the Architects 'Board of Western 
Australia Amendment By-laws 1999. 

	

2. 	The by-laws amended 

The amendments in these by-laws are to the Architects 'Board 
of Western Australia By-laws 1965*. 

[* Reprinted as at 30 March 1989. 
For amendments to 21 December 1999 see 1998 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 19.] 

	

3. 	By-law 31 amended 

By-law 31 is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$85" and inserting 
instead — 

" $100 "; 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$170" and inserting 
instead — 

" $200 "; 

(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting "$50.00-  and inserting 
instead 
44 $75  5,. 

	

4. 	By-law 41 amended 

By-law 41 is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$320" and inserting 
instead — 

" $550 "; 



380 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 [1 February 2000 

in paragraph (b) 
instead — 

" $250 "; 

in paragraph (c) 
instead — 

" $350 

The Common Seal of the 
Architects' Board of Western 
Australia was at the time of the 
above resolution affixed in the 
presence of— 

by deleting "$160" and inserting 

by deleting "$220" and inserting 

BRIAN WRIGHT,  Chairman. 
JOAN McIN"I'Y RE, Registrar. 

Confirmed by the Governor, 

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


