
28 June 2002 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3059 

CE306* 

Travel Agents Act 1985 

Travel Agents Amendment Regulations 2002 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Travel Agents Amendment 
Regulations 2002. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002. 

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Travel Agents 
Regulations 1986*. 

[* Reprinted as at 20 May 1997.] 

4. Regulation 6 amended 

(1) 	Regulation 6(1) is amended as follows: 

(a)  in paragraph (a) by deleting "$666" and inserting 
instead - 
44 	$683 

(b)  in paragraph (a) by deleting "$144" and inserting 
instead - 
44 	$148 

(c)  in paragraph (b) by deleting "$666" and inserting 
instead - 
" 	$683 

(d)  in paragraph (b) by deleting 	$144" and inserting 
instead - 
" 	$148 

(e)  in paragraph (c) by deleting "$1000" and inserting 
instead - 
" 	$1026 

(1) in paragraph (c) by deleting "$144" and inserting 
instead - 
" 	$148 	". 

(2) 	Regulation 6(2) is amended by deleting "$1440" and inserting 
instead - 
46  $1477 " 



3060 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 28 June 2002 

5. Regulation 9 amended 

Regulation 9 is amended by deleting "$21." and inserting 
instead — 

" $21.55. ". 

6. Regulation 10 amended 

(1) Regulation 10(2) is amended by deleting "$10" and inserting 
instead — 

" $10.30 ". 

(2) Regulation 10(3) is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$10" and inserting 
instead — 

" $10.30 "; 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$10" and inserting 
instead — 

" $10.30 "; 

(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting "$122" and inserting 
instead — 

" $125.20 ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


