
20 June 2003 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2243 

1'0301* 
Firearms Act 1973 

Firearms Amendment Regulations 2003 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Firearms Amendment 
Regulations 2003. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on I July 2003. 

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Firearms 
Regulations 1974* . 

[* Reprinted as at 8 June 2001. 
For amendments to 20 May 2003 see 2001 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 104-5, and 
Gazette 28 June 2002.] 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

(1) Regulation 4(1a) is amended by deleting the Table and inserting 
the following Table instead — 

44 

Ta ble of application forms and fees 

Form 	 Kind of Licence 	 Fee 
No. 	 ($)  

1 	Firearm Licence — original issue (1 year) 	134 

1 	Firearm Licence — renewal (1 year) 	29 



2244 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 20 June 2003 

Form 	 Kind of Licence 	 Fee 
No 	 ($) 

1 	Firearm Collector's Licence - original issue (5 years) 	272 
1 	Firearm Collector's Licence - renewal (5 years) 	50 
2 	Corporate Licence - original issue (1 year) ...............272 
2 	Corporate Licence - renewal (1 year) ........................73 

(2) Regulation 4(laa)(b) is amended by deleting "$18" and 
inserting instead - 

" $23 ". 

(3) Regulation 4(lc) is amended by deleting the Table and inserting 
the following Table instead - 

Table of application forms and fees 

Form Kind of Licence Fee 
No ($) 

3 Dealer's Licence - original issue (1 year) .................... 272 
3 Dealer's Licence - renewal (1 year) ............................. 73 
3 Repairer's Licence - original issue (1 year) ................. 272 
3 Repairer's Licence - renewal (1 year) .......................... 49 
3 Manufacturer's Licence - original issue (1 year) ......... 272 
3 Manufacturer's Licence - renewal (1 year) ................... 49 
3 Shooting Gallery Licence - original issue (1 year) ............. 179 
3 Shooting Gallery Licence - renewal (1 year) ................ 53 
4 Ammunition Collector's Licence - original issue (5 years) 179 
4 Ammunition Collector's Licence - renewal (5 years) 49 

5. Regulation 5 amended 

Regulation 5(1)(b) is amended by deleting "$12" and inserting 
instead - 

" $36 " 

6. Regulation 7 amended 

Regulation 7(5a) is amended by deleting "$12" and inserting 
instead - 

" $15 ". 

7. Regulation 8 amended 

Regulation 8(2a) is amended by deleting "$12" and inserting 
instead - 
44  $15 " 



20 June 2003 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2245 

8. 	Regulation 27 

Regulation 27(1)(a) is amended by deleting "$299" and 
inserting instead — 

" $332 ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


