
2740 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 125 June 1999 

HE302* 

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927 

Hospitals (Services Charges for 
Com pensable Patients) Determination 

Amendment Notice 1999 

Made by the Minister for Health under section 37(3)(a0 of the Act and 
regulation 5(2) and (3) of the Hospitals (Services Charges) 
Regulations 1984. 

1. Citation 

This notice may be cited as the Hospitals (Services Charges for 
Compensable Patients) Determination Amendment Notice 1999. 

2. Commencement 

This notice comes into operation on 1 July 1999. 



25 Jutie 19991 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2741 

3. The notice amended 

The amendments in this notice are to the Hospitals (Services 
Charges for Compensable Patients) Determination 1994*• 

[* Published in Gazette 24 June 1994, pp.  2878-9. 
For amendments to 9 June 1999 see 1998 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, pp.  164-5.] 

4. Schedule amended 

(1) Part 1 of the Schedule is amended as follows: 

(a) in item 1 by deleting "$543 per day" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $629 per day 

(b) in item 2 by deleting "$525 per day" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $541 per day 

(c) in item 3 by deleting "$156 per day" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $160 per day ". 

(2) Part 2 of the Schedule is amended by deleting "$80 per day" and 
inserting instead - 
44 $90 per day ". 

(3) Part 3 of the Schedule is amended as follows: 

(a) in item 1 by deleting S80" and inserting instead - 

" $90 "; 

(b) in item 2 by deleting "$80" and inserting instead - 

" $90 "; 

(c) in item 4 by deleting "$80" and inserting instead - 

" $90 ". 

(4) Part 4 of the Schedule is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$525 per day" and 
inserting instead - 

" $405 per day 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$437 per day" and 
inserting instead - 

" $429 per day ". 

JOHN DAY, Minister for Health. 


