
25  June 19991 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2739  

HEALTH 

HE301* 

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927 

Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 1999 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Hospitals (Services 
Charges) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 1999. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 1999. 

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Hospitals 
(Services Charges) Regulations 1984*. 
[* Reprinted as at 14 February 1995. 

For amendments to 9 June 1999 see 1998 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 164, and Gazette 
22 January and 28 May 1999.] 

4. Schedule amended 

(1) Part I of the Schedule is amended as follows: 

(a) in item 1(b)(i) by deleting "$356.00 per day" and 
inserting instead — 

" $376.00 per day "; 

(b) in item 1(b)(ii) by deleting "$213.00 per day" and 
inserting instead — 

" $216.00 per day "; 

(c) in item 1(e) by deleting "$652.00 per day" and inserting 
instead — 

" $669.00 per day ". 



2740 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 [25 June 1999  

(2) Part II of the Schedule is amended by deleting "$80.00 per day" 
and inserting instead — 

" $90.00 per day ". 

(3) Part III of the Schedule is amended in item 1(b) by deleting 
"$80.00" and inserting instead — 

" $90.00". 

(4) Part IV of the Schedule is amended as follows: 

(a) in item (b) by deleting "$156.00 per day" and inserting 
instead — 

" $160.00 per day "; 

(b) in item (d) by deleting "$470.00 per day" and inserting 
instead — 

" $560.00 per day ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


