
2070 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 [25 May 1999 

TIZ302* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Fees for Vehicle Licences) 
Regulations 1999 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under section 28A. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Road Traffic (Fees for 
Vehicle Licences) Regulations 1999. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on the day of their 
publication in the Government Gazette. 

3. Specified day: section 28A 

For the purposes of section 28A(3) of the Act, the specified day 
in relation to these regulations is 1 July 1999. 

4. The Road Traffic Act 1974 amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to Part III of 
Schedule 2 to the Road Traffic Act 1974* . 
[* Reprinted as at 25 March 1997. 

For amendments to 5 May 1999 see 1998 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 1, pp. 217-219.] 

5. 	Second Schedule amended 

(1) Division 2 is amended as follows: 

(a) in item 2 by deleting "$12.00" and inserting instead — 

" $12.26 "; 

(b) in item 3 by deleting "$12.00" and inserting instead — 

" $12.26 "; 

(c) in item 4 by deleting "$6.00" and inserting instead — 

" $6.13 "; 

(d) in item 5 by deleting "$3.00 per 100 kg or part thereof of 
the tare weight." and inserting instead 
44 

$3.06 per 100 kg or part thereof of the tare 
weight, subject to a maximum fee equal to the 
fee payable for licence class 1SV under 
Division 4, item 7 of this Schedule. 

(e) in item 6(1) by deleting "$24.00" and inserting 
instead — 

" $24.52 "; 



25 May 1999] 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2071 

(0 in item 6(2) by deleting "$36.00" and inserting 
instead — 

" $36.79 ". 

(2) Division 4 is amended after item 6 by adding the following 
item — 

44 

7. Caravan (trailer type), plant trailer, tractor 
(not prime mover type), tractor plant, 
forklift truck, tow motor, mobile crane 

For a caravan (trailer type), plant trailer, tractor 
(not prime mover type), tractor plant, forklift 
truck, tow motor, or mobile crane the fee is an 
amount corresponding to the licence class in the 
Table to this item. 

Table 

Licence Class 

1SV 

Fee 
$ 
75 

2SV2 250 
2SV3 500 
2SV4 750 
2SV5 1000 
2SV6 1250 
2SV7 1500 
2SV8 1750 
2SV9 2000 

9, 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


