
2796 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 [12 May 1998 

TR303* 
SHIPPING AND PILOTAGE ACT 1967 

JETTIES ACT 1926 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

NAVIGABLE WATERS AMENDMENT REGULATIONS (No. 2) 1998 
Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

Citation 
1. These regulations may be cited as the Navigable Waters Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 1998. 

Commencement 
2. These regulations come into operation on 1 July 1998. 

Principal regulations 
3. In these regulations the Navigable Waters Regulations* are referred to as the principal 
regulations. 

[ * Reprinted as at 3 July 1995. 
For amendments to 6 April1998 see 1997 Index to Legislation of Western Australia, 
Table 4, p. 250-511 

Regulation 45B amended 

	

4. 	(1) The Table to regulation 45B (3) of the principal regulations is amended — 
(a) in item (i), by deleting "40" and substituting the following — 

49 
(b) in item (ii), by deleting "79" and substituting the following — 

" 96 "; 
(c) in item (iii), by deleting "147" and substituting the following — 

" 179 ";and 
(d) in item (iv), by deleting "201" and substituting the following — 

" 245 ". 
(2) 	Regulation 45B (4) of the principal regulations is amended by deleting "$19.00." 

and substituting the following — 
" $23.00. ". 

Regulation 45BAA amended 
5. Regulation 45BAA (4) of the principal regulations is amended by deleting "$19.00" 
and substituting the following — 
" $23.00 ". 

Regulation 45BA amended 

	

6. 	(1) Regulation 45BA (2) of the principal regulations is amended by deleting "$206.00" 
in the 2 places where it occurs and substituting in each place the following — 
" $207.00 ". 
(2) 	Regulation 45BA (3) of the principal regulations is amended by deleting "$155.00" 

and substituting the following — 
" $156.00 ". 

Regulation 45D amended 
7. Regulation 45D (2) of the principal regulations is amended by deleting "$5.15," and 
substituting the following — 
" $5.20, ". 
By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


