
1830 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	11 September 1998 

PREMIER AND CABINET 

PR301 

Public Sector Management Act 1994 

Public Sector Management (Review Procedures) 
Amendment Regulations 1998 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

	

1. 	Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Public Sector 
Management (Review Procedures) Amendment 
Regulations 1998. 

	

2. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Public Sector 
Management (Review Procedures) Regulations 1995*. 

[* Published in Gazette 24 November 1995, pp. 5475-88. 
For amendments to 3 August 1998 see 1997 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 219, and 
Gazette 2 January 1998.] 

	

3. 	Regulation 8 amended 

(1) 	Regulation 8(1) is amended by deleting — 

or to have been materially affected by, )5. 

(2) 	Regulation 8(3) is amended as follows: 

(a) by deleting "7 days" and inserting instead — 

" 	15 days "; 

(b) by deleting — 
CC 	

, or to have been materially affected by, )5.  

(3) 
	

Regulation 8(4) is amended by deleting "7 days" and inserting 
instead — 

" 	15 days ". 

	

4. 	Regulation 13 amended 

Regulation 13(1)(a) is deleted and "or" after it and the following 
is inserted instead — 

64 

(a) 	within 7 days after the expiry of — 

(i) 	the 15 days referred to in 
regulation 8(3); or 



1 September 1998] 	GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 4831 

(ii) the 7 days referred to in regulation 9(1), 

as the case requires; or 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


