
2670 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 
	

[10 June 1997 

WORKSAFE 

WS301 
OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH ACT 1984 

OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH AMENDMENT 
REGULATIONS 1997 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

Citation 

1. These regulations may be cited as the Occupational Safety and Health 
Amendment Regulations 1997. 

Commencement 

2. These regulations come into operation on 1 July 1997. 

Principal regulations 

3. In these regulations the Occupational Safety and Health 
Regulations 1996* are referred to as the principal regulations. 

[4' Published in Gazette 27 September 1996, pp. 4837-5080.1 

Regulation 5.44 amended 

4. Regulation 5.44 of the principal regulations is amended by deleting 
"$2 860" and substituting the following — 

" $2 946 ". 



10 June 1997] 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2671 

Schedule 6.1 amended 

5. Schedule 6.1 to the principal regulations is amended by deleting "$21.25" 
and substituting the following — 

" $22.00 ". 

Schedule 6.2 amended 

6. Schedule 6.2 to the principal regulations is amended by deleting 155.00" 
in both places where it occurs and substituting in each case the following — 

" $57.00 ". 

Schedule 6.3 amended 

7. Schedule 6.3 to the principal regulations is amended — 

(a) in item 1 by deleting 155.00" and substituting the following — 

" $57.00 "; 

(b) in item 2 by deleting 128.00" and substituting the following — 

" $29.00 "; 

(c) in item 3 by deleting 1660.00" and substituting the following — 

" $680.00 "; 

(d) in item 4 by deleting 1110.00" and substituting the following — 

" $113.00 "; and 

(e) in item 5 by deleting "$330.00" and substituting the following — 

" $340.00 ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


