


13 May 1997]

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2341

(®)

(c)

(d)

(e)

in item 1 (b), by deleting “35.00” and “60.00” and substituting
respectively the following —

“ 36.00 "and“ 61.00 7

in item 2, by deleting “21.00” and substituting the following —
“ 2150 7

in item 3, by deleting “29.00” and substituting the following —
“ 30.00 ”;and

in item 4, by deleting “92.00” and substituting the following —
“ 95.00 .

Regulation 15 amended

6. (1)
(a)

()

Regulation 15 (1) of the principal regulations is amended —

in paragraph (a), by deleting “$66.50,” and substituting the
following —

“ $68.50, ”;and

in paragraph (b), by deleting “$133.00.” and substituting the
following —

“ $137.00. ™.

(2) Regulation 15 (2) of the principal regulations is amended —

(a)

(b)

in paragraph (a), by deleting “$10.00,” and substituting the
following —

“ $10.25, ”; and

in paragraph (b), by deleting “$20.00.” and substituting the
following —

“ $20.50. .

Division 8 — Road Traffic (Licensing) Regulations 1975
Schedule 2 amended

7. Schedule 2 to the Road Traffic (Licensing) Regulations 1975* is amended
in the column headed “Fee” —

(a)

(b)

(c)

(d)

(e)

in item 1, by deleting “124.50” and “52” and substituting
respectively the following —

“ 12820 "and“ 53.50 7

in item 2, by deleting “63.25”7, “27” and “41.50” and substituting
respectively the following —

“ 65.15 7,“ 27.80 "and“ 42.75 7

in item 3, by deleting “52” and “103.75” and substituting
respectively the following —

“ 5350 "and“ 106.80 7;

in item 4, by deleting “6.25” and “10.25” and substituting
respectively the following —

“ 640 "and“ 10.50 ”;
in item 5, by deleting “14.00” and substituting the following —
“ 14.70 ™



2342 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [13 May 1997

(f) in item 6, by deleting “12.50” and substituting the following —
[ 12.80 ”;

(g) initem 7, by deleting “6.25” and substituting the following —
“ 640 7

(h) in item 9, by deleting “6.25” and substituting the following —
[13 6. 40 2 ;
(i) initem 10 —

(i) by deleting “15.00” and substituting the following —
“ 15,30
(i) by deleting “77.75” and substituting the following —
“ 80.00 7
(iii) by deleting “26” and substituting the following —
“ 26.80 ”; and
(iv) by deleting “39.50” and substituting the following —
“ 4070 7
(3)  in item 11, by deleting “593.50” and substituting the following —
“ 611.00 7
(k) in item 12 —
(i) by deleting “5 940” and substituting the following —
“ 6118.00 7;

(i) by deleting “1 188” in the 2 Ii;laces where it occurs and
substituting in each place the following —

“ 1224.00 %

(iii) by deleting “593.50” and substituting the following —
“ 611.00 *;

(iv) by deleting “118.25” and substituting the following —
“ 121.80 ”; and

(v) by deleting “52” and substituting the following —
“ 53.60 7

() initem 13, by deleting “296.75” and substituting the following —

“ 30565 7

(m) in item 14, by deleting “12.50” and substituting the following —
“ 1280 7

(n) in item 15, by deleting “134.75” and substituting the following —
“ 138.80 7

(o) in item 16, by deleting “12.50” and substituting the following —
L 12.80 ”;






