
1580 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 [2 April 1996 

HE302 

HOSPITALS AND HEALTH SERVICES ACT 1927 

HOSPITALS (SERVICES CHARGES) AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 
1996 

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council. 

Citation 

1. These regulations may be cited as the Hospitals (Services Charges) 
Amendment Regulations 1996. 

Commencement 

2. These regulations come into operation on 4 April 1996. 

Schedule amended 

3. Part 1 of the Schedule to the Hospitals (Services Charges) Regulations 
1984* is amended — 

(a) in item 1 (c) by deleting 125.50" and substituting the 
following — 

" 	$26.05 	f); 

(b) in item 1 (d) (i) by deleting "$87.25" and substituting the 
following — 

" 	$87.80 	”; 

(c) in item 1 (d) (ii) by deleting "$81.25" and substituting the 
following — 

" 	$81.80 	9 ); 

(d) in item 3 (a) by deleting 125.50" and substituting the 
following — 

" 	$26.05 	"; 

(e) in item 3 (b) by deleting 125.50" and substituting the 
following — 

" 	$26.05 	"; and 



2 April 1996] 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 1581 

(0 	in item 4 by deleting "$23.35" and substituting the following — 
" 	$23.80 	". 

(* Reprinted as at 14 February 1995. 
For amendments to 14 March 1996 see 1994 Index to Legislation 
of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 140-142, and Gazette 31 March, 
27 June and 17 October 1995.1 

By His Excellency's Command, 
J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Council. 


