25 June 1996] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2929

JM303
LOCAL COURTS ACT 1904

LOCAL COURT AMENDMENT RULES 1996

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council.

Citation

1. These rules may be cited as the Local Court Amendment Rules 1996.

Commencement

2. These rules take effect one month after their publication in the Gazette.

Appendix amended

3. The Appendix to the Local Court Rules 1961* is amended in Part II in
the Table headed “Table of Court Fees” —

(a) in item 1 by deleting “$40” in both places where it occurs and
substituting in each place the following —

“ $42 7



2930 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [25 June 1996

(®) in _item 1 by deleting “$80 $160” and substituting the
following —

“ $86 $170 ™

(¢) in item 2 by deleting “$30” in each place where it occurs and
substituting in each place the following —

“® $32 ” ;

(d) in item 3 by deleting “$50 $100 $150” and substituting
the following —

“ $53 $106 $160 7

(e) in item 3A by deleting “$40 $80 $120” and substituting
the following —

“ $42 $85 $127 7%

(H in item 4 by deleting “$20 = $40 $80” and substituting
the following —

“ $21 $42 $85 7

(g0 in item 12 (a) by deleting “$50 $100 $150” and
substituting the following —

“ $53 $106 $160 7

(h) in_item 12 (b)_ by deleting “$20 $40 $80” and
substituting the follo“?i’ng i

“ $21 $42 $85 7

(i) in_ item 13 (a) by deleting “$50 $100 $150” and
substituting the following — :

“ $53 $106 $160 ”; and

()  in item 13 (b) by deleting “$75” in each place where it occurs and
substituting in each place the following —

“ $80 ”.

[* Reprinted as at 26 February 1996.
For amendments to 16 May 1996 see Gazette 22 March 1996.]

By His Excellency’s Command,
J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Council.



