
25 June 1996] 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2993 

TR304 SHIPPING AND PILOTAGE ACT 1967 

PORTS AND HARBOURS AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1996 

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council. 

Citation 

1. 	These regulations may be cited as the Ports and Harbours Amendment 
Regulations 1996. 

Commencement 

2. 	These regulations come into operation on 1 July 1996. 

Principal regulations 

3. 	In these regulations the Ports and Harbours Regulations* are referred to 
as the principal regulations. 

[* Published in the Gazette of 3 February 1966 at pp.277-92. 
For amendments to 16 May 1996 see 1995 Index to Legislation of 
Western Australia, Table 4, pp.253-56.] 

Regulation 14 amended 

4. 	Regulation 14 (3) of the principal regulations is amended by deleting 
"$3 121" and substituting the following — 

" 	$3 238 ". 

Regulation 15 amended 

5. 	Regulation 15 (3) of the principal regulations is amended by deleting 
"$514" and substituting the following — 
c, $533  ”. 

Regulation 15A amended 

6. (1) Regulation 15A (1) of the principal regulations is amended by 
deleting 1512" and substituting the following — 
CC $531 ". 

(2) 	Regulation 15A (2) of the principal regulations is amended — 

(a) by deleting 1512" and substituting the following — 

" $531 "; and 

(b) by deleting 1607" and substituting the following — 

" $630 ". 

Regulation 15B amended 

7. 	Regulation 15B of the principal regulations is amended — 

(a) by deleting "$243" and substituting the following — 

" $252 "; and 

(b) by deleting "$349" and substituting the following — 

" $362 ". 



2994 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 [25 June 1996 

Regulation 15C amended 

	

8. 	Regulation 15C of the principal regulations is amended - 

(a) by deleting "$77" and substituting the following - 
44 $80 "; 

(b) by deleting "$514" and substituting the following - 
44 $533 ";and 

(c) by deleting "$1334" and substituting the following - 
cc $1384 ". 

Regulation 16 amended 

	

9. 	Regulation 16 (d) of the principal regulations is amended (d) by deleting 
"$564" and substituting the following - 

" $585 

Third Schedule amended 

10. (1) Part I of the Third Schedule to the principal regulations is 
amended by deleting item 1 and substituting the following item - 
CC 

[Reg. 15] 

1. 	The charges for pilotage of vessels into and out of ports in the 
State at which pilotage is provided are - 

PORT 	GROSS REGISTERED 
TONNAGE OF VESSEL 

CHARGES FOR BOTH 
INWARD AND 
OUTWARD PILOTAGE 

$ 

BROOME 

WYNDHAM 
(In respect of 

Ebetween 
Nicholls 
Point and 
berth) 

Up to 1 499 
1500-3000 
3001-5000 
5001-10000 
10 001 - 20 000 
20 001 - 30 000 
Exceeding 30 000 

Up to 1 499 
1500-3000 
3001-5000 
5001-10000 
10 001 - 20 000 
20 001 - 30 000 
Exceeding 30 000 

1 621 
2 169 
2 611 
3 145 
3 885 
4 545 
4 986 

1 838 
2 388 
3 018 
3 806 
4 777 
5 390 
5 956 

(2) 	Item 2 of Part I of the Third Schedule to the principal regulations is 
amended - 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$426" and substituting the 
following - 
44 $442 ";and 

(b) in paragraph (c) - 

(i) 	by deleting "$243" and substituting the following - 

$252 "; and 



25 June 1996] 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2995 

(ii) by deleting "$349" and substituting the following — 

" $362 ". 

(3) 	Part II of the Third Schedule to the principal regulations is amended 
by deleting from the items set out in column 1 of the Table to this 
subregulation the fees respectively set out in column 2 of the Table and 
substituting in each case the corresponding fee set out in column 3 of the 
Table. 

Column 1 

TABLE 

Column 2 	Column 3 

Item Deleted 
Fee 

Substituted 
Fee 

1 (1) (b) (i) 74 77 
1 (1) (b) (ii) 95 99 
1 (1) (b) (iii) 141 146 
1 (1) (b) (iv) 216 224 
1 (1) (b) (v) 330 342 
1 (1) (b) (vi) 515 534 

2 68 71 

4(1) 74 77 
4(1) 95 99 
4(1) 191 146 
4 (1) 216 224 
4 (1) 330 342 
4 (1) 515 534 

By His Excellency's Command, 

J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Council. 


