
25 June 1996] 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2973 

PE302 
SECURITY AGENTS ACT 1976 

SECURITY AGENTS AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1996 

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council. 

Citation 

1. These regulations may be cited as the Security Agents Amendment 
Regulations 1996. 

Commencement 

2. These regulations come into operation on 1 July 1996. 

Principal regulations 

3. In these regulations the Security Agents Regulations 1977* are referred 
to as the principal regulations. 

[* Published in Gazette 9 September 1977, pp. 3262-71. 
For amendments to 7 June 1996 see 1995 Index to Legislation of 
Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 250-1.] 

Regulation 3 amended 

4. (1) Regulation 3 (3) of the principal regulations is amended in the 
table — 

(a) by deleting "$28" and substituting the following — 

" $29 "; 

(b) by deleting "$56" and substituting the following — 

" $58 "; and 

(c) by deleting "$20" and substituting the following — 

" $21 ". 

(2) 	Regulation 3 (5) is amended in the table — 

(a) by deleting 1152" and substituting the following — 

" $157 "; 

(b) by deleting "$75" and substituting the following — 

" $78 "; and 



2974 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 
	

[25 June 1996 

(c) 	by deleting "$20"  and substituting the following — 

" $21 ". 

(3) 	Regulation 3 (11) is amended by deleting "$30" and substituting the 
following — 

ti $31  ,,. 

By His Excellency's Command, 

J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Council. 


