3184 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [2 July 1996

FaAIR TRADING

FT301

WEIGHTS AND MEASURES ACT 1915
WEIGHTS AND MEASURES AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1996

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council.

Citation

1. These regulations may be cited as the Weights and Measures Amendment
Regulations 1996.

Principal regulations

2. In these regulations the Weights and Measures Regulations 1927* are
referred to as the principal regulations.

[* Published in Gazette 3 June 1927, pp. 1416-48.

For amendments to 13 May 1996 see 1995 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 317-22.]

Table XIIT amended
8. Table XIII to the principal regulations is amended —

(@) in item 1 (a), by deleting “14.00” and substituting the
following —

“16.00 ”;

() in item 1 (b), by deleting “$28.00” and substituting the
following —

“ $32.00 ”;

(0 in item 2 (a), by deleting “14.00” and substituting the
following —

“ 16.00 7

(d in item 2 (b), by deleting “14.00” and substituting the
following —

“ 16.00 7

() in item 2 (c), by deleting “$28.00" and substituting the
following —

“ $32.00 7

() in item 3 (a), by deleting “14.00” and substituting the
following —

“ 16.00 7

(@ in item 3 (b), by deleting “14.00” and substituting the
following —

“ 16.00 7;

(h) in item 3 (c), by deleting “$28.00° and substituting the
following —

“ $32.00 7



2 July 1996]

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3185

@

@

(k)

M

(m)

(n)

(o)

(p)

(@

(r)

(s)

(t)

()

8%

(w)

169]

in item 4 (a),
following —

“ 64.00 ”;

in item 4 (b),
following —

“ 64.00 7
in item 5, by deleting “$28.00” and substituting the following —
“ $32.00

in item 7 (a),
following —

“ 16.00 7

in item 7 (),
following —

“ 32.00 7

by deleting “56.00” and substituting the

by deleting “56.00” and substituting the

by deleting “14.00” and substituting the

by deleting “28.00” and substituting the

in item 7 (c¢), by deleting “56.00° and substituting the

following —
“ 64.00 ”;

in item 8 (a), “42,00” and substituting the

following —
“ 48.00 7

in item 8 (b),
following —

“ 64.00 7

in item 8 (c¢), by deleting “112.00”
following —

“ 128.00 7

deleting

deleting “56.00” and substituting the

and substituting the

in item 9, by deleting “56.00” and substituting the following —
“ 64.00 7

in item 10 (a), by deleting “28.00” and substituting the
following —

“ 32.00 7

in item 10 (b), by deleting “$28.00" and substituting the
following —

“ $32.00 7

in item 11, by deleting “14.00” and substituting the following —
“ 16.00 7

in item 12, by deleting “46.00” and substituting the following —
“ 48.00 7;

in item 13, by deleting “$28.00” and substituting the following —

“ $32.00 ”; and
in item 14, by deleting “$14.00” and substituting the following —
“ $16.00 ”.



3186

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

Table XIIIB amended

4. Table XIIIB to the principal regulations is amended —

(a)

(b)

)

(d)

(e)

®

(&

(h)

@

@

in item 1, by deleting “56.00” and substituting the following —

“ 64.00 7

in items 2, 3, 4, and 5, by deleting “14.00” and substituting the
following —

“ 16.00 7

in item 5A, by deleting “56.00” and substituting the following —

“ 64.00 7

in item 6 (a) and (b), by deleting “28.00” and substituting the
following —

“ 2900 ”;

in item 6 (¢) —

(i) in subparagraph (i), by deleting “14.00” and substituting
the following —

“ 16.00 7

(ii) in subparagraph (i), by deleting “$28.00” and substituting
the following —

“ $32.00 ”;and

(iii) in subparagraph (iii), by deleting “14.00” and substituting

the following —

“ 16.00
in item 6 (d) (i), by deleting “$9.00” and substituting the
following —
“ $10.00 *;
in item 6 (e), by deleting “28.00”
following —

“ 32.00 7

and substituting the

in item 7 (a), by
following —

“ 16.00 ”;

deleting “10.00” and substituting the

in item 7 (b) and (c), by deleting “14.00” and substituting the
following —

“ 16.00 ”; and

in item 8, by deleting “$14.00” and substituting the following —
“ $16.00 ”

By His Excellency’s Command,

J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Council.

[2 July 1996



