
4394 
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 [23 August 1994 

WC301 WORKERS' COMPENSATION AND REHABILITATION ACT 1981 

WORKERS' COMPENSATION AND REHABELITATION AMENDMENT 
REGULATIONS (NO. 4) 1994 

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council. 

Citation 

1. These regulations may be cited as the Workers' Compensation and 
Rehabilitation Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 1994. 

Principal regulations 

2. In these reg. ulations the Workers' Compensation and Rehabilitation 
Regulations 1982* are referred to as the principal regulations. 

[* Reprinted as at 30 April 1992. 
For amendments to 2 August 1994 see 1993 Index to Legislation of 
Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 329-30, and Gazette of 
18 February, 31 March and 24 June 1994.] 

Regulation 16 repealed and a regulation substituted 

3. Regulation 16 of the principal regulations is repealed and the following 
regulation is substituted — 

Maximum amount for expenses payable under Schedule 1 
of the Act 

16. The maximum amount payable for reasonable expenses 
incurred in respect of anything described in column 1 of the Table 
to this regulation is the amount specified opposite that 
description in column 2 of the Table. 

Table 

Column 1 
	

Column 2 

Description of Expense 
	

Maximum 
Amount 

1.  Funeral expenses (clause 4 or clause 17 (2)) . . . . $4 000 

2.  Wheeled chair or similar appliance 
(clause 17 (4)) 	  $7 000 

3.  Meals and lodging (clause 19) 	  $70 per day 



23 August 19941 
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 4395 

Regulation 17 amended 

4. Regulation 17 of the principal regulations is amended by deleting "$50" 
and substituting the following — 

" 	$90 	". 

Regulation 17A amended 

5. Regulation 17A of the principal regulations is amended — 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$76" and substituting the 
following — 

" 	$78 	"; and 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$44" and substituting the 
following — 

" 	$45 	”. 

By His Excellency's Command, 
D. G. BLIGHT, Clerk of the Council. 


