
3014 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 
	

128 June 1994 

11302 
PEARLING ACT 1990 

PEARLING (GENERAL) AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1994 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in Executive 
Council. 

Citation 

1. These regulations may be cited as the Pearling (General) Amendment 
Regulations 1994. 

Commencement 

2. These regulations come into operation on 1 July 1994. 

Principal regulations 

3. In these regulations the Pearling (General) Regulations 1991* are 
referred to as the principal regulations. 

[* Published in the Gazette of 27 December 1990. 
For amendments to 9 June 1994 see 1993 Index to Legislation of 
Western Australia, Table 4, p.199.] 

Regulation 6 amended 

4. Regulation 6 of the principal regulations is amended — 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$220.00" and 
following — 

" 	$228.00 	''; 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$275.00" and 
following — 

" 	$285.00 	and 

(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting 1275.00" and 
following — 

" 	$285.00 

substituting the 

substituting the 

substituting the 

Regulation 8 amended 

5. Regulation 8 of the principal regulations is amended --- 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting 122.00" and substituting the 
following 

	

$23.00 	>,. 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$90.00" and substituting the 
following — 

" 	$93.00 	"; and 

(c) 	in paragraph (c) by deleting "$22.00" and substituting the 
following — 

" 	$23.00 7 > 



28 June 1994] 
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3015 

Regulation 9 amended 

6. Regulation 9 of the principal regulations is amended — 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$275.00" and substituting the 
following — 

Li 
	

$285.00 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$275.00" and substituting the 
following — 

" 	$285.00 

(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting "$275.00" and substituting the 
following — 

" 	$285.00 	"; and 

(d) in paragraph (d) by deleting "32c" and substituting the 
following — 

33 cents 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor. 
D. G. BLIGHT, Clerk of the Council. 


