


GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [14 June 1994

(b) in subregulation (2) —
. (1) by deleting “$471” and substituting the following -—
5 $497 ”: and
(ii) by deleting “$571” and substituting the following —
& $589 g
Regulation 15B amended
7. Regulation 15B of the principal regulations is amended —
(a) by deleting “$229” and substituting the following —

b $236 ? and
(b) by deleting “$328” and substituting the following —

“ $338 g

Regulation 15C amended
8. Regulation 15C of the principal regulations is amended —
(a) Dby deleting “$72” and substituting the following —
“ 874 5
(b) by deleting “$484” and substituting the following —
= $499 ”: and
(¢) by deleting “$1 256" and substituting the following —
o $1 295 ”,

Regulation 16 amended

Regulation 16 of the principal regulations is amended in paragraph (d)
by deleting “$530” and substituting the following — . P

o $647 &

Third Schedule amended
%’21‘1; ITl'n'a Third Schedule to the principal regulations is amended in

(a) by deleting item 1 and substituting the following item —
“ [Reg. 15}
1. The charges for pilotage of vessels into and

out of ports in the State at which pilotage is
provided are —

PORTS GROSS CHARGES
REGISTERED  FOR BOTH
TONNAGE OF INWARD
VESSEL

AND
OUTWARD
PILOTAGE
$
BROOME Up to 1 499 1516
1 500 — 3 000 2 030
3 001 — 5 000 2 443
5001 — 10 000 2 942
10 001 — 20 000 3 636
20 001 — 30 000 4 253
Exceeding 30 000 4 666






