
3188 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 
	

(29 June 1993 

111H306 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

W. A. MARINE (SURVEYS AND CERTIFICATES OF SURVEY) 
AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1993 

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council. 

Citation 

1. These regulations may be cited as the W. A. Marine (Surveys and 
Certificates of Survey) Amendment Regulations 1993. 

Commencement 

2. These regulations shall come into operation on 1 July 1993. 

Principal regulations 

3. In these regulations the W.A. Marine (Surveys and Certiftcates of Survey) 
Regulations 1983* are referred to as the principal regulations. 

[* Published in the Gazette of 1 July 1983 at pp. 2195-208. 
For amendments to 14 June 1993 see 1992 Index to Legislation of 
Western Australia, Table 4, p. 315.] 

Schedule 1 amended 

4. (1) Schedule 1 to the principal regulations is amended by deleting item 
1 and substituting the following item — 

1. 	SURVEY FEES 
(a) 	The fees for examination of plans of a vessel, surveys carried 

out during construction, and annual or subsequent surveys 
are as follows — 

Column 1 	Column 2 	Column 3 

Length of Vessel Menial Examinatia nal Surveys during 	Annual or 
plans 	 Construction 	Subsequent 

Surveys 

($) 	($) 	($) 

Over 0 but not exceeding 5 92 186 101 
Over 5 but not exceeding 7 92 198 101 
Over 7 but not exceeding 8 118 263 109 



29 June 1993] 
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3189 

Length of Vessel (Metrw) 

Column 1 

Ezaminalion of 
plans 

($) 

Column 2 

Surveys during 
Construction 

($) 

Column 3 

Annual 	or 
Subsequent 
Surveys 

($) 

Over 8 but not exceeding 9 145 342 115 
Over 9 but not exceeding 10 171 421 122 
Over 10 but not exceeding 11 210 506 135 
Over 11 but not exceeding 12 250 592 147 
Over 12 but not exceeding 13 289 677 162 
Over 13 but not exceeding 14 329 763 174 
Over 14 but not exceeding 15 369 848 187 
Over 15 but not exceeding 16 407 934 200 
Over 16 but not exceeding 17 447 1019 213 
Over 17 but not exceeding 18 487 1105 227 
Over 18 but not exceeding 19 525 1190 240 
Over 19 but not exceeding 20 565 1276 253 
Over 20 but not exceeding 21 611 1368 272 
Over 21 but not exceeding 22 657 1459 293 
Over 22 but not exceeding 23 703 1551 313 
Over 23 but not exceeding 24 749 1644 332 
Over 24 but not exceeding 25 795 1735 351 
Over 25 but not exceeding 26 842 1827 371 
Over 26 but not exceeding 27 887 1919 390 
Over 27 but not exceeding 28 934 2012 411 
Over 28 but not exceeding 29 979 2104 431 
Over 29 but not exceeding 30 1025 2195 450 
Over 30 but not exceeding 31 1078 2294 476 
Over 31 but not exceeding 32 1131 2393 503 
Over 32 but not exceeding 33 1182 2491 529 
Over 33 but not exceeding 34 1235 2590 556 
Over 34 but not exceeding 35 1288 2689 582 
Over 35 but not exceeding 36 1341 2787 609 
Over 36 but not exceeding 37 1394 2886 635 
Over 37 but not exceeding 38 1446 2985 660 
Over 38 but not exceeding 39 1499 3083 686 
Over 39 but not exceeding 40 1551 3182 712 
Over 40 but not exceeding 41 1610 3286 747 
Over 41 but not exceeding 42 1670 3392 780 
Over 42 but not exceeding 43 1729 3498 812 
Over 43 but not exceeding 44  1788 3602 845 
Over 44 but not exceeding 45 1847 3708 878 
Over 45 but not exceeding 46 1906 3812 910 
Over 46 but not exceeding 47 1965 3917 943 
Over 47 but not exceeding 48 2024 4023 975 
Over 48 but not exceeding 49 2084 4128 1008 
Over 49 but not exceeding 50 2142 4233 1042 
Over 50 metres 2202 4338 1074 

The fee shown in column 3 for annual and subsequent survey shall 
be reduced by $60.00 if the vessel does not have a radio installation. 

The fee shown in column 3 for annual and subsequent survey 
provides for the survey and one further inspection to clear a 
deficiency notice. When further inspections are necessary to 
complete the survey, an additional fee of $70.00 per visit will be 
charged. 

When the vessel is to be issued with a Classification Certificate in 
respect of its hull and machinery by a recognized Classification 
Society, the fee payable shall be 50% of the fee prescribed in column 
1 and column 2 and 100% of the fee prescribed in column 3. 

(b) Where a vessel is to be surveyed for more than one class of 
vessel, the fee payable under Column 1 (examination of plans) 
shall be increased by the amount of one-half of the fee for 
each additional class; 

(c) Where a vessel is to be surveyed for more than one class of 
vessel, the fee payable under Column 3 (annual or subsequent 
survey) shall be increased by the amount of one-half the fee 
for each additional class; 



3190 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 
	

[29 June 1993 

(d) Issue of a certificate of survey 
where the Department accepts 
a certificate of survey by another 
marine authority 	  $39.00; 

(e) For the extension of a certificate 
of survey 	  $39.00; 

(f) Issue of a replacement certificate 
of survey, or a copy of a 
certificate of survey, or a Permit 
to Operate, or a Towage Permit 	  $39.00; 

(g) For a survey specially required subsequent to repairs 
following damage or accident, the fee is $39.00 per hour or 
part thereof, plus associated travel costs; 

(h) The fee for consideration of an application to change the class 
of the vessel is one-half of the appropriate fee for examination 
of plans for each class; 

(i) The fee for a survey carried out to change the class of the 
vessel is one-half of the appropriate fee, for annual or 
subsequent survey, for each class; 

(j) Where examination of plans is required due to significant 
alterations to a vessel, the fee is one-half the appropriate fee 
payable under Column 1 (Examination of Plans); 

(k) Where an additional survey is carried out due to significant 
alterations to a vessel, the fee is one-half of the appropriate 
fee for a survey carried out during construction. 

(2) 	Schedule 1 to the principal regulations is amended — 

(a) 	in it,em 2 — 

(i) 	in subitems (a), (b), (c), (d) and (e) by deleting 135.00" and 
substituting in each case the following — 
i4 $39.00 10. 

(ii) in subitem (f) by deleting 1424.00" and substituting the 
following — 

" 	$477.00 	"; and 

(iii) in subitems (g) and (h) by deleting "$105.00" and substituting 
in each case the following — 

" $118.00 

(d) 	in it,em 3 — 

(i) in subitems (a) and (b) by deleting "31" and substituting in 
each case the following — 

" 35 	";and 

(ii) in subitem (c) by deleting "18" and substituting the 
following — 

" 20 PP. 

(e) 	by deleting item 4 and substituting the following item — 

4. 	Annual exemption fee (regs. 10 and 10A) — 

(a) For recording or transfer 
of vessel 	  14; 

(b) For registration or renewal where 
the length of the vessel — 

(i) 	does not exceed 5 metres 	 28; 

it 



29 June 1993] 
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3191 

(ii) exceeds 5 metres but does 
not exceed 10 metres 	 56; 

(iii) exceeds 10 metres but does 
not exceed 20 metres 	 104; 

(iv) exceeds 20 metres 	 142. 

(f) 

	

	in item 5 by deleting "$88" and substituting the following — 

" $99 "; 

and 

(g) 	in item 6 by deleting "$55" and substituting the following — 

" $62 91.  

By His Excellency's Command, 
D. G. BLIGHT, Clerk of the Council. 


