
2 July 1993) 
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 
	

3259 

BUILDING MANAGEMENT 

	

BM301 	 ARCHITECTS ACT 1921 

ARCHITECTS' BOARD OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
AMENDMENT BY-LAWS 1993 

Made by the Architects' Board of Western Australia. 

Citation 

	

1. 	These b-laws may be cited as the Architects' Board of Western Australia 
Amendment 'By-laws 1993. 

Principal by-laws 

2. In these by-laws the Architects' Board of Western Australia By-laws 
1965* are referred to as the principal by-laws. 

[* Reprinted as at 30 March 1989. 
For subsequent amendments see 1991 Index to Legislation of 
Western Australia, p. 253.] 

By-law 31 amended 

	

3. 	By-law 31 of the principal by-laws is amended — 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$65.00" and substituting the 
following — 

" 	$85 	"; and 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting 1140.00" and substituting the 
following — 
CS $170 

By-law 41 amended 

4. 	By-law 41 of the principal by-laws is amended — 

(a) in 	paragraph 
following 

(a) 	by deleting 1205" and substituting the 

$320 

(b) in 	paragraph 
following — 

(b) by deleting "$85" and substituting 	the 

" 	$160 "; and 

(c)  in 	paragraph 
following — 

(c) 	by deleting "$120" and substituting 	the 

" 	$220 
	

ft 

The Common Seal of the Architects' Board of Western Australia was affixed hereto in 
the presence of— 

JOHN KOIVISTO, Chairman. 
JOAN McINTYRE, Registrar. 

Confirmed by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council on the 8th of June 1993. 
D. G. BLIGHT, Clerk of the Council. 

11958-2 


