
5252 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	[24 September 1993 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 

EP301 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION ACT 1986 
ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 

(NO. 2) 1993 

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council on the 
recommendation of the Environmental Protection Authority. 

Citation 

1. 	These regulations may be cited as the Environmental Protection Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 1993. 



24 September 1993] 	GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 5253 

Principal regulations 
2. 	In these regulations the Environmental Protection Regulations 1987* are 
referred to as the principal regulations. 

[* Published in the Gazette of 20 February 1987 at pp. 444-9. 
For amendments to 7 September 1993 see 1992 Index to Legislation 
of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 66 and the Gazette of 13 July 1993.] 

Regulation 5 amended 
3. 	Regulation 5 of the principal regulations is amended — 

(a) in subregulation (1) by deleting "$50." and substituting the 
following — 
" 	$80. 	"; and 

(b) in subregulation (2) (a) — 
(i) in subparagraph (ii) by deleting "$70" and substituting the 

following — 
" 	$120 	"; and 

(ii) in subparagraph (iii) by deleting "$70" and substituting the 
following — 
" 	$120 

Schedule 2 and 3 repealed and Schedules substituted 
4. 	Schedule 2 and 3 to the principal regulations are repealed and the following 
Schedules substituted — 

tt 

Schedule 2 
(regulation 5 (2) (a)) 

LICENCE FEES FOR PREMISES BASED ON DISCHARGE 
OF WASTE 

Column 1 	 Column 2 

Maximum quantity of waste permitted to 	Annual 
be discharged from premises 	 fee 

 more than 20 cubic metres per day 	 $120 
More than 20 cubic metres, but not more 

than 200 cubic metres, per day 	 $230 
More than 200 cubic metres, but not more 

than 2000 cubic metres, per day 	 $680 
More than 2000 cubic metres, but not more 

than 10000 cubic metres, per day 	 $2680 
More than 10000 cubic metres per day 	 $5600 



5254 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	[24 September 1993 

Schedule 3 
(regulation 6 (2) (b) and (3)) 

LICENCE FEES FOR SPECIFIC PRESCRIBED PREMISES 

Column 1 	 Column 2 

Premises 
(per annum) 

1. PREMISES BEING USED FOR — 

(a) 	Abrasive Blasting Works — 
(i) in which all blasting is carried 

out in an enclosed chamber from 
which particulate emissions from 
the exit gases conform to the 
standard of concentration 
prescribed in the Clean Air 
(Determination of Air Impurities 
in Gases Discharged to the 
Atmosphere) Regulations 1983 	80 

(ii) all other abrasive blasting works 	320 

(b) 	Asphalt and Bitumen Works — 
(i) processing not more than 10 000 

tonnes of material per year 	80 
(ii) processing more than 10 000 

tonnes but not more than 100 000 
tonnes of material per year 	400 

(iii) processing more than 100 000 
tonnes but not more than 
1 000 000 tonnes of material per 
year 	800 

(iv) processing more than 1 000 000 
tonnes of material per year 	1600 

(c) 	Cement and Lime Works — 
(i) producing lime or grinding 

cement clinker not more than 
200 000 tonnes of material per 
year 	1600 

(ii) producing more than 200 000 
tonnes of lime or grinding more 
than 200 000 tonnes of cement 
clinker per year 	3200 

(d) 	Cement Product Manufacturing Works — 
(i) processing more than 500 tonnes 

but not more than 5000 tonnes of 
concrete per year 	80 

(ii) processing more than 5000 tonnes 
but not more than 50 000 tonnes 
of concrete per year 	400 

(iii) processing more than 50 000 
tonnes but not more than 500 000 
tonnes of concrete per year 	800 

(iv) processing more than 500 000 
tonnes of concrete per year 	1600 

(e) 	Ceramic Works (excluding glass works) — 
(i) producing not more than 5000 

tonnes of products per year 	80 
(ii) producing more than 5000 tonnes 

but not more than 50 000 tonnes 
of products per year 	400 

(iii) producing more than 50 000 
tonnes but not more than 500 000 
tonnes of products per year 	800 

(iv) producing more than 500 000 
tonnes of products per year 	1600 



24 September 1993] 
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 5255 

	

(f) 	Chemical Manufacturing Works — 

	

(i) 	excluding plaster (gypsum) works 
and alumina or bauxite 
refineries — 

(A) producing not more than 
100 tonnes of total chemical 
products per year 	80 

(B) producing more than 100 
tonnes but not more than 1000 
tonnes of total chemical products 
peryear 	400 

(C) producing more than 
1000 tonnes but not more than 
10 000 tonnes of total chemical 
products per year 	800 

(D) producing more than 
10 000 tonnes but not more than 
100 000 tonnes of total chemical 
products per year 	1600 

(E) producing more than 
100 000 tonnes but not more than 
500 000 tonnes of total chemical 
products per year 	3200 

(F) producing more than 
500 000 tonnes of total chemical 
products per year 	4800 

(ii) used for the treatment or 
processing of plaster (gypsum) 	400 

(iii) used for the treatment or 
processing of alumina or 
bauxite — 

(A) processing not more 
than 1 000 000 tonnes of material 
peryear 	1600 

(B) processing more than 
1 000 000 tonnes of material per 
year 	3200 

	

(g) 	Concrete Batching Plants — 
(i) processing more than 500 tonnes 

(230 cubic metres) but not more 
than 5000 tonnes (2300 cubic 
metres) of concrete or concrete 
products per year 	80 

(ii) processing more than 5000 tonnes 
(2300 cubic metres) but not more 
than 50 000 tonnes (23 000 cubic 
metres) of concrete or concrete 
products per year 	400 

(iii) processing more than 50 000 
tonnes (23 000 cubic metres) but 
not more than 500 000 tonnes 
(230 000 cubic metres) of concrete 
or concrete products per 
year 	800 

(iv) processing more than 500 000 
tonnes (230 000 cubic metres) of 
concrete or concrete products per 
year 	1600 

	

(h) 	Fibreglass Works — 

	

(i) 	using more than 500 kilograms 
but not more than 5 tonnes of 
polyester resin per year 	80 

(ii) using more than 5 tonnes but not 
more than 250 tonnes of polyester 
resin per year 	160 

(iii) using more than 250 tonnes of 
polyester resin per year 	320 



5256 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 
	

[24 September 1993 

(i) 	Gas Works based on coal, oil or hydrocarbon 
derivatives — 

(i) producing not more than 50 000 
gigajoules per year 	400 

(ii) producing more than 50 000 
gigajoules but not more than 
1 000 000 gigajoules per year 	800 

(iii) producing more than 1. 000 000 
gigajoules but not more than 
5 000 000 gigajoules per year 	1600 

(iv) producing more than 5 000 000 
gigajoules per year 	3200 

(j) 	Glass Works — 
(i) producing not more than 1000 

tonnes of products per year 	80 
(ii) producing more than 1.000 tonnes 

but not more than 10 000 tonnes 
of products per year 	400 

(iii) producing more than 10 000 
tonnes but not more than 100 000 
tonnes of products per year 	800 

(iv) producing more than 100 000 
tonnes of products per year 	1600 

(k) 	Grinding and Milling Works — 
(i) producing more than 200 tonnes 

but not more than 5000 tonnes of 
material per year 	80 

(ii) producing more than 5000 tonnes 
but not more than 50 000 tonnes 
of material per year 	400 

(iii) producing more than 50 000 
tonnes but not more than 500 000 
tonnes of material per year 	800 

(iv) producing more than 500 000 
tonnes but not more than 
5 000 000 tonnes of material per 
year 	1600 

(v) producing more than 5 000 000 
tonnes of material per year.. 	3200 

(I) 	Loading or Unloading Vessels 	320 

(m) Primary Metallurgical Works smelting or 
converting ores to metals of any kind — 

(i) producing not more than 10 000 
tonnes of metal per year 	800 

(ii) producing more than 10 000 
tonnes but not more than 200 000 
tonnes of metal per year 	1600 

(iii) producing more than 200 000 
tonnes of metal per year 	3200 

(n) 	(i) 	Oil Refinery 	3200 
(ii) Waste Oil Reclaiming Refinery 	400 

- — 
(o) 	Scrap Metal Reclaiming Works — 

(i) reclaiming not more than 200 
tonnes of metal per year 	80 

(ii) reclaiming more than 200 tonnes 
but not more than 2000 tonnes of 
metal per year 	400 

(iii) reclaiming more than 2000 tonnes 
but not more than 10 000 tonnes 
of metal per year 	800 

(iv) reclaiming more than 10 000 
tonnes of metal per year 	1600 



24 September 1993) 
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 5257 

(p) Stockyards 	  80 

(q) 	Waste Water Treatment Plants in which the 
volume treated is — 

(i) more than 20 m3  but not more 
than 200 ms per day 	80 

(ii) more than 200 m3  but not more 
than 2000 m3  per day 	160 

(iii) more than 2000 m3  but not more 
than 10 000 m3  per day 	240 

(iv) more than 10 000 m3  per day 	400 

(r) 	Works used for the Rendering or Reduction of 
Animal Matter — 

(i) producing not more than 100 
tonnes of products per week 	 

(ii) producing more than 100 tonnes 
of products per week 	 

2. PREMISES ON WHICH THERE IS 
ERECTED ANY — 

(a) Boiler or boilers consuming or capable of 
consuming either alone or in the aggregate 
more than 500 kilograms of combustible 
material per hour — 

(i) consuming more than 500 
kilograms but not more than 1 
tonne of combustible material per 
hour 	80 

(ii) consuming more than 1 tonne but 
not more than 10 tonnes of 
combustible material per 
hour 	160 

(iii) consuming more than 10 tonnes 
but not more than 50 tonnes of 
combustible material per 
hour 	400 

(iv) consuming more than 50 tonnes 
but not more than 100 tonnes of 
combustible material per 
hour 	800 

(v) consuming more than 100 tonnes 
of combustible material per 
hour 	1600 

(b) 	Coke Works — 
(i) producing not more than 10 000 

tonnes of cokeper year 	400 
(ii) producing more than 10 000 

tonnes but not more than 100 000 
tonnes of coke per year 	800 

(iii) producing more than 100 000 
tonnes of cokeper year 	1600 

(c) 	Furnace used for the melting of non-ferrous 
metals — 

(i) melting not more than 200 tonnes 
of metal per year 	80 

(ii) melting more than 200 tonnes but 
not more than 2000 tonnes of 
metal per year 	400 

(iii) melting more than 2000 tonnes 
but not more than 10 000 tonnes 
ofmetal per year 	800 

(iv) melting more than 10 000 tonnes 
ofmetal per year 	1600 

160 

400 

13144-2 



5258 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	[24 September 1993 

(d) 	Furnace or cupola used for the smelting of 
alloys of iron or steel — 

(i) melting not more than 1000 
tonnes of metal per year 	80 

(ii) melting more than 1000 tonnes 
but not more than 10 000 tonnes 
of metal per year 	400 

(iii) melting more than 10 000 tonnes 
but not more than 100 000 tonnes 
of metal per year 	800 

(iv) melting more than 100 000 tonnes 
of metal per year 	1600 

3. PREMISES ON WHICH FUEL BURNING 
EQUIPMENT OR INDUSTRIAL PLANT IS 
OPERATED BY THE WESTERN AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT RAILWAYS COMMISSION 
CONSTITUTED UNDER THE GOVERNMENT 
RAILWAYS ACT 1904 — 

In the aggregate in respect to all premises 	3200 

By His Excellency's Command, 
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Council. 

Recommended by the Environmental Protection Authority at Meeting No. 579 held on 
Thursday, 2 September 1993 and amendment recommended at Meeting No. 580 held on 
Wednesday, 8 September 1993. 

C. H. WELKER, Deputy Chairman. 


