
30 June 1992] 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2905 

MH304 

WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

W.A. MARINE AMENDMENT REGULATIONS (NO. 2) 1992 

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council. 

PART 1— PRELIMINARY 

Citation 

1. These regulations may be cited as the WA Marine Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 1992. 

Commencement 

2. These regulations shall come into operation on 1 July 1992. 

PART 2— WA. MARINE (ADJUSTMENT OF COMPASSES) 
REGULATIONS 1983 

Regulation 4 amended 

3. The Scale of Fees to regulation 4 of the WA Marine (Adjustment of 
Compasses) Regulations 1983* is amended by deleting — 
CC 

CC 

181 
130 
158 
215 
358 
430 
583 	"and substituting the following — 

184 
135 
164 
224 
372 
447 
606 

[* Published in the Gazette of 1 July 1983 at pp. 2191-2. 
For amendments to 10 June 1992 see 1991 Index to Legislation of 
Western Australia, p.551.] 

PART 3— WA. MARINE (CERTIFICATES OF COMPETENCY 
AND SAFETY MANNING) REGULATIONS 1983 

Schedule 3 amended 

4. Schedule 3 to the WA. Marine (Certificates of Competency and Safety 
Manning) Regulations 1983* is repealed and the following schedule 
substituted — 
CC SCHEDULE 3 

[Regs. 14, 17 and 27A] 

FEES 

Fees applicable 

Registration fee, to be paid for certificate 
of competency, or part thereof 	  44 

Examination fee, for each examination 	  22 



2906 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 [30 June 1992 

FEES 

Fees applicable 	 $ 
Eyesight test 	......................................12 

Issue of certificate 	..................................17 

Copy of certificate ...................................17 
[* Published in the Gazette of 1 July 1983 at pp.  2209-40. 

For amendments to 10 June 1992 see 1991 Index to Legislation of 
Western Australia, pp.  551-2.1 

PART 4— WA. MARINE (HIRE AND DRIVE) REGULATIONS 1983 

Regulation 4 amended 

5. Regulation 4 of the WA. Marine (Hire and Drive) Regulations 1983* is 
amended in subregulation (2) (e) - 

(a) in clause 3.1.2 (1) (b) by deleting "$106" and substituting the 
following - 

$200 

(b) by inserting after clause 3.1.2 (2) the following clause - 
it 	3.1.2 (3) Where a person has acquired an existing  

hire and drive operation, that person shall be entitle 
to carry on that operation - 

(a) if the person makes an application for a 
transfer of the existing licence; 

(b) upon payment of a transfer fee of $100 to 
the Authority; and 

(c)provided the person operates the hire and 
drive operation from the same location 
and complies with all existing conditions 
of the licence.  

and 

(c) in clause 3.1.3 (m) by deleting "$37" and substituting the 
following - 

$38 	". 
[* Published in the Gazette of 1 July 1983 at pp.  2185-8. 

For amendments to 10 June 1992 see 1991 Index to Legislation of 
Western Australia, p.  552.1 

PART 6 - WA. MARINE (LOAD LINES) REGULATIONS 1983 

Regulation 6 amended 

6. Regulation 6 (1) of the W.A. Marine (Load Lines) Regulations 1983* is 
amended by deleting "$21"  and substituting the following - 

" 	$22 	". 
[* Published in the Gazette of 1 July 1983 at p.  2193. 

For amendments to 10 June 1992 see 1991 Index to Legislation of 
Western Australia, p.  553.1 



30 June 19921 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2907 

PART 6— WA. MARINE (MERCANTILE MARINE) 
REGULATIONS 1983 

Regulation 7 amended 

7. Regulation 7 of the WA Marine (Mercantile Marine) Regulations 1983* 
is amended - 

(a) in subregulation (1) by deleting "$21" and substituting the 
following - 

" 	$22 	"; and 

(b) in subregulation (2) by deleting "$21"  and substituting the 
following - 

$22 

[* Published in the Gazette of 1 July 1983 at p.  2184. 
For amendments to 10 June 1992 see 1991 Index to Legislation of 
Western Australia, P. 553.1 

PART 7— W.A. MARINE (I IOTELEPHONY) REGULATIONS 1981 

Regulation 16 amended 

8. Regulation 16 of the WA Marine (Radiotelephony) Regulations 1981* is 
amended - 

(a) in subregulation (2a) by deleting "$143" and substituting the 
following - 

" 	$149 	"; and 

(b) in subregulation (2b) by deleting "$73" and substituting the 
following - 
" 17 .-. p'o 

P Published in the Gazette of 27 November 1981 at pp.  4839-46. 
For amendments to 10 June 1992 see 1991 Index to Legislation of 
Western Australia, p .1 

PART 8— W.A. MARINE (SURVEYS AND CERTIFICATES 
OF SURVEY) REGULATIONS 1983 

Principal regulations 

9 In this Part the WA Marine (Surveys and Certificates  of Survey) 
Regulations 1983*  are referred to as the principal regulations. 

[* Published in the Gazette of 1 July 1983 at pp.  2195-208. 
For amendments to 10 June 1992 see 1991 Index to Legislation of 
Western Australia.] 

Regulation 10A amended 

10 Regulation bA of the principal regulations is amended by repealing 
subregulation (2). 



2908 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 [30 June 1992 

Schedule I amended 

11. Schedule 1 to the principal regulations is amended - 

(a) in item 1 (a) - 

(i) by deleting "shall be reduced by $51" and substituting the 
following - 

shall be reduced by $53 	"; and 

(ii) by deleting "additional fee of $60.00" and substituting the 
following - 
64 additional fee of $62 

(b) 	by deleting items 1 (b) to 1 (j) and substituting the following - 
(b)  Where a vessel is to be surveyed for more than 

one 	class 	of vessel, 	the 	fee 	payable 	under 
Column 	1 	(examination 	of plans) 	shall 	be 
increased by the amount of one half of the fee 
for each additional class; 

(c)  Where a vessel is to be surveyed for more than 
one 	class 	of vessel, 	the 	fee 	payable 	under 
Column 3 (annual or subsequent survey) shall 
be increased by the amount of one half the fee 
for each additional class; 

(d)  Issue of a certificate of survey 
where the Department accepts 
a certificate of survey by another 
marine authority 	.................$35.00; 

(e)  For the extension of a certificate 
of survey ........................$35.00; 

(I) Issue of a replacement certificate 
of survey, or a copy of a 
certificate of survey, or a Permit 
to Operate, or a Towage Permit 	......$35.00; 

(g)  For a survey specially required subsequent to 
repairs following damage or accident, the fee is 
$35.00 per hour or part thereof, plus associated 
travel costs; 

(h)  The fee for consideration of an application to 
change the class of the vessel is one half of the 
appropriate fee for examination of plans for 
each class; 

(i)  The fee for a survey carried out to change the 
class of the vessel is one half of the appropriate 
fee, for annual or subsequent survey, for each 
class; 

(j)  Where examination of plans is required  due to 
significant alterations to a vessel, the fee is one 
half 	the 	appropriate 	fee 	payable 	under 
Column 1 (examination of plans); 

(k)  Where an additional survey is carried out due 
to significant alterations to a vessel, the fee is 
one half of the appropriate fee for a survey 
carried out during construction. 

(c) 	in item 2- 

(i) 	in subitems (a), (b), (c), (d) and (e) by deleting "$34.00" and 
substituting in each case the following - 

$35.00 



30 June 1992] 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2909 

(ii) in subitem (f) by deleting "$408.00" and substituting the 
following — 

$424.00 	"; and 

(iii) in subitems (g) and (h) by deleting "$101.00" and 
substituting in each case the following — 
0( $105.00 77;  

(d) in item 3 — 
(i) in subitems (a) and (b) by deleting "30" and substituting in 

each case the following — 

31 	"; and 

(ii) in subitem (c) by deleting "17" and substituting the 
following — 

18 

(e) by deleting item 4 and substituting the following item — 
It 4. 	Annual exemption fee (regs. 10 and 10A) — $ 

(a) For recording or transfer 
of vessel 	  12; 

(b) For registration or renewal where 
the length of the vessel — 

(i) does not exceed 5 metres 	 27; 

(ii) exceeds 5 metres but does 
not exceed 10 metres 	 54; 

(iii) exceeds 10 metres but does 
not exceed 20 metres 	 101; 

(iv) exceeds 20 metres 	 138. 77. 

(f) in item 5 by deleting "is $85" and substituting the following — 
I t 	or owners agent is $88 

	71;  

and 

(g) in item 6 by deleting "$51" and substituting the following — 

$55 	77. 

By His Excellency's Command, 
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Council. 

(I 


