
8 February 1991] 
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 651 

RA302 

GAMING COMMISSION ACT 1987 
GAMING COMMISSION AMENDMENT REGULATIONS (No. 4) 1990 

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council. 
Citation 
1. These regulations may be cited as the Gaming Commission Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 1990. 
Regulation 39 amended 
2. Regulation 39 of the Gaming Commission Regulations 1988* is amended— 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$2" and substituting the following-
" $5 "; and 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$10" and substituting the following-
" $50 ". 

['Published in the Gazette of 29 April 1988 at pp. 1295-304. For amendments 
to 14 November, 1990 see p. 245 of 1989 Index to Legislation of Western Australia 
and Gazettes of 6 April and 4 May 1990.] 
By His Excellency's Command, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Council. 


